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American Studies Program Wins Honor Medal 
The Freedoms Foundation of Valley 

Forge, Pa., has recognized the Harding 
University American Studies Program and 
sen~or Debbie Garrett as national award 
winners in the 1984 program. 

The American Stijdies Program was 
selected as the principal award winner in the 
category or community programs and will 
receive an encased George Washington 
Honor Medal for its year-long program~ 
Garrett, a native of Brookston, Ind., was the 
winner of a Valley Forge Honor Certificate 
for Excellence for an ~ssay "What 'Free' 
Means In Free Enterprise." 

"We're especially delighted to have our 
studen.ts and programs recognized," said 
Dr. David Burks, director of the American 
Studies Program and dean of the School of 
Business. "This is Harding's first award .in 
the community category and that is 
especially gratifying to us." 

The Freedoms. Foundation Awards 
Program ~ designed to promote an ap­
preciation and understanding for freedom 
and the American way of life. Gordon R. 
Hall, Chief Justice of the Supreme Court in 
Utah; served· as chairman of the 1984 
awards )ury. 

The multifaceted Harding American 
Studies Program provides educational 
opportunities for the students, the com­
m unity and high school students in the 
areas of citizenship, government, economics 
and business. 

The program includes the highly ac-

claimed lecture series which annually brings 
nationally known personalities to the 
campus and the Searcy community. Past 
speakers have included ne~ commentator 
Paul Hai:vey, ec()nomist Milton Friedman, 
Senator Dale Bumpers, President Gerald 
Ford, businessman /Sam Walton, author 
Alex Haley and Senator Sam Ervin. 

Other facets of the year-long program 
include the Youth Citizenship Seminar for 
high school students, the Management 
Seminar for area business and management 
leaders, the student business a.nd economics 
teams, field trips for University students to 
the economic and historical centers of our 
country and an invitational business games 
for high schools and junior . colleges. 

In addition, the special activities of the 
Center for Private Enterprise and the Center 
for Management ElCcellence have an 
outreach to the community as well as state 
wide; 

A member of the Harding Students in 
Free Enterprise Economics team, Miss 
Garrett s~ke extensively at high schools on 
the theme, "America, Freedom and You." 
She is a business management major and a 
national winner of the Milton Friedman 
Economics Essay comPetiiio~. . 

. Harding is recognized as Ii leader in 
economic education and has received more 
than 50 awards from the Freedoms 
Foundation. Harding's American Studies 
Program, originally known as the School of 
American Studies, began in 1953. 

Orr to Speak at GraduatiQn 
340 to Receive Dearees 

Roy Orr, chairman of the board of the 
First National Bank of DeSoto, Texas, will 
present the commencement address to 
approximately 340 candidates at graduation 
ceremonies May 12. 

Previously, Orr has served as a member of 
the Datlas County Commissi()ners Court, 
president of the De.Soto School Board and 
mayor of DeSoto. 

In state and regional activities, Orr has 
been chairman of the Texas State 
Democratic Executive Committee, president 
of the North Central Texas Council of 
Governments, regional chairman of the 
Regional Trans~rtation Council, chairman 
of the Texas County and District 
Retirement System Board and is currently a 
member of the Texas Aeronautics Board. 

Orr has served as a delegate at the 
National Democratic Convention. He was 
appointed to the Advisory Commission on 
Intergovernmental Relations Board by 
former President Jimmy Carter and was 
appointed by President Ronald Reagan as a 
member of the .President's Advisory 
Committee of Federalism. 

Orr has received several awards including 
Oak Cliff Man ofthe Year; The Press Club 
of Dallas, Headliner of the Year; City of 

DeSoto, Roy Orr Park and the County Line 
Road was named Roy Orr Boulevard. 

President Clifton Ganus will award 120 
Bachelor o.f Art and 105 Bachelor of 
Business Administration degrees to lead the 
number of diplomas presented. 

The University's graduation ceremonies 
will take place at 2:30 p.m. in the Benson 
Auditorium. 

America" Studies Director David Burlu presents former Cha"ceUor of West GemuJ"Y 
Helmut Schmidt a Natiorud Leadership' Video Library certificate after his lecture April 9. 

Accreditation 'Team Visits 
The North Central Association Ac­

creditation Committee has sent a rough 
draft of the written report to Harding 
administrators after their on-campus visit 
Feb. 1O~13. 

Harding is a mem ber of the North Central 
Association of Schools and Universities and 
is seeking continued accreditation of its 
curriculum and facilities. 

"We have submitted a detailed self-study 
ofthe University which was followed by the 
on-site visit by the study committee," said 
Dr. Neale Pryor, vice president for academic 
affairs. 

"We have received a favorable 
preliminary report and believe that 
eVerything is on track for the to-year cer­
tification of our program," he said. "The 
committee examined our operation frQm 
one end to the other and I believe they were 
favorably impressed with the commitment 
of our program~" 

A five member team, chaired by Dr. Dean 
Hubbard, president of Northwest Missouri 
State University, conducted the in-depth 
examination of the school. Other members 
were Dr. Jeffrey Barry, president of Walsh 
College (Mich.), Dorothy Chappell, 
chairperson of the department of biology, 
Wheaton College (Ill.), Sister Mary Cahoon, 
senior vice president and dean ofthe College 
of St. Scholastica (Minn.) and George 
Ralph, professor oftheatre at Hope College 
(Mich.). 

Pryor indicated the study report was 
complimentary of the University in a 
number of areas. They included the morale 
and spirit of cooperation among the faculty, 
the neatness of the campus and facilities, 

the development of the Harding University 
in Florence, Italy, program. and the 
University's work in student retention. 

Other strengths mentioned were the 
su pport of the Board of Trustees and the 
commitment in all seginents to the stated 
mission of the school. 

The report suggested study should be 
given by the administration to long range 
planning linking enrollment with fund 
raising needs and recruitment of future 
faculty. 

The accrediting team expressed a concern 
for the lack of a systemic approach in 
planning for the migration of the students to 
the School of Business from the arts and 
sciences. The team stressed the University's 
need to evaluate the impact of the situation 
on the school as a whole, especially the 
increase in business majors . 

They also noted concern that students 
needed more access to computer terminals, 
suggesting a development of a delegation of 
time schedule. 

Other recommendations in the report 
inclUded a need for a broader range of 
liberal arts books for students to choose 
from in the book store and a latent anxiety 
on the part of the faculty concerning their 
degree of involvement in the governance of 
the institution. 

"We feel very positive about the 
preliminary report," Pryor said, "and 
anticipate that the final report from North 
Central will be made sometime this sum­
mer." 

Harding became a member of the North 
Central in 1954 and has undergone periodic 
evaluations to continue its accreditation. 
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Co_liege Bowl Team Places Fourth in Regional Tournament 
The University College Bowl team placed 

fourth among 17 teams in the Region 12 
tournament at Rice University Feb. 16-17. 
The accomplishment was Harding's second 
highest finish in five years of participation 
in the program. In 1983 the team placed 
third. 

Harding's victories came over Rice, 
Austin College and a repeat over Rice, 
before losing two gameS in the double 
elimination format to eventual champion 
Tulane University and runner-up Texas 
A&M University. 

Team captain Greg York, a student at the 
Harding Graduate School ,of Religion in 
Memphis, led the team with :20 correct toss­
up questions. York has served as captain all 
five years. 

Senior David Smith of Searcy, in his 
secon!i year on the team, had 10 correct 
answers. Smith is majoring in history, 
English and political science. 

Freshman Dan Shill, a music major from 
Memphis, answered six questions. The 
fourth position on the team was shared by 
senior Michael Brumley, ,a pre-med student 
from Columbus, Miss., and sophomore 
Barry Phillips, a nursing major from 

Memphis. Each answered three toss-ups, 
Brumley in three gamp-s and l'hillips in two. 

Baylor placed third. Ranked behind 
Harding, in order, were University of Texas 
at Austin, Rice, Austin College; University 
of Arkansas, Texas Christian University, 
University of Houston, University of Texas 
at Permian Basin, North Texas ~tate 
University, Stephen F. Austin State, 
University of Texas at Arlington, University 
of Texas at San Antonio, Trinity University 
and Louisiana State. 

Harding's faculty coaches are Dr. Fred 
Jewell, professor of history; Dr. Larry Long, 
associate professor of English; and Dr. 
Dennis Organ, professor of English. They 
coordinated a 32-team double elimination 
tournament on campus during the fall that 
produced the varsity team from thp whining 
squad named "Krunch" and top players 
from other teams. 

The Krunch team was composed of Bob 
Wilson and Dave Favre, who graduated in 
December and thus were ineligible for the 
varsity, and Glenn Studebaker and Phillips. 
Two all-stars who did not make the 
traveling team were Gil Foster and Ron 
Williams. 

Members of the College Bowl team from left Michael Brumley, graduate student Greg 
York, and David Smith practice before the regional competition in Houston, Texas. 

National Society Names Scholarship for Dr. Joseph Pryor 
The establishment of a 5500 scholarship 

named the Dr. Joseph E. Pryor Award by 
Region VI of Alpha Chi national honor 
scholarship society was announced at the 
society's national convention in Louisville, 
Ky., March 28-30. 

Dr. Pryor is executive director of the 
National Council of Alpha Chi, having 
served as national secretary-treasurer for 
many years and in numerous other offices as 
well. 

Also, Dr. Pryor, retired vice president and 
dean of Harding who now serves as a 
professor of physical science, was presented 
a plaque for his 28 years of sponsorship of 
Harding's Arkansas Eta chapter. 

The scholarship will be available to a 
junior or senior member of Region VI, 
which is located in the Northeast, for 
outstanding research or creative work. 

Nine University students presented 
numbers on the program during the 
weekend. They are: Billie Albany, an art 
major from Glasgow, Ky., slides and paper, 
"Sistene Chapel - The Touch of the 
Master's Hand"; Fran Coon, a public 
administration major from Santa Rosa 
Beach, Fla., paper entitled ('II Malgovemo: 
The Italian Political System"; Eddie 
Madden, English major from Newport, 
Ark., paper entitled "Thematic Significance 
of Time in Absalom, Absalom!"; Greg 
Kays, a biology major from Benton, Ark., a 
paper entitled "Endorphins: Did God 
Renege His Curse?"; 

Debra Woodell of Parkersburg, W. Va., 
and Rachel Sullins of El Dorado, Ark., 
nursing majors, a paper entitled 
"Significant Effects of Students' Attitudes 
Upon Their Level of Stress in Nursing 
School"; Connie Alexander, home 
economics major from McKinney, Texas, 
piano solo, "Fantasia," by Benjamin Lees; 
Sherry Daniel, an English major from 
Westfield, N.J., a reading of original short 
stories entitled' "The Leavetaking" and 
"The Mermaid"; and Becha Evans, an art 
major from Searcy, a display of original art. 

The meeting was attended by about 380 
student delegates and faculty from more 
than 100 of the 240 chapters in 45 states. 
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Accompanying the Harding delegates 
were Dr. Don England, president of Region 
II, Dr. Arthur Shearin and Dr. Dennis 
Organ, who is editor of society publications. 

Harding's chapter of Alpha Chi inducted 
62 . students into the national honor 
scholarship society for the spring semester. 

The new members -are Jon Ashley of 
Bonita, Calif., Dorothy Bell of Pangburn, 
Ark., Dawn Blaine of Camp Hill, Pa., Vince 
Breed~ove of Ft. Smith, Ark., David Burton 
of Livonia, Mich., Melissa Chaffin of 
Hermitage, Tenn., Darrell Cheatham of 
Little Rock, Ark., Dru Denham of Hebron, 
Ky., Terry Dinterman of Walkersville, Md.; 

Wade Dunn of Logan, Ohio, Gail En· 
dicott of West Plains, Mo., Earl Fonville of 
Colleyville, Texas, Kelley Garrison of Mt. 
Pleasant, Mich., Julie Grahn of Lakewood, 
Colo., Ronna Griggs of House Springs, Mo., 
Alexa Grissom of Imboden, Ark.; 

Becky Harris of Springville, Ind., William 
Hess of Lexington, Ky., Melinda Hillis of 
Plano, Texas, Brant Holladay of Dunwoody, 
Ga., Denise Huffman of Hazsville, Kan., 
Donna Hulett and Joey Lowery of Newport, 
Ark., Tommy Jernigan of Ravenden, Ark., 
Angela Kays of Benton, Ark., Scott Kennon 
of Eldorado Springs, Mo.; 

James Lanier of Gahanna, Ohio, Suzanne 
Lum of Camden, Ark., Karen Luna of 
Memphis, Tenn., Kenneth Martin of 
Roanoke, Va., Dawn Mason and Karen 
Mason of Tabernacle, N.J., Judy McDowell 
of Muskogee, Okla., Amanda McMillen of 
Fridley, Maine, Susan Meek of 
Caruthersville, Mo., Susan Mitchell of 
Nashville, Tenn.; 

Chad Necessary of Springfield, Ohio, 
Shari Nelson of Florissant, Mo., Kimberly 
Parker of Louisa, Ky., Darlynn Patterson of 
Royse City, Texas, Sandra Patterson of 
Diana, Texas, Bryan Pruitt of Nichols, 
Iowa, Cheryl Rainey of Asheville, N.C., 
Tracy Rhinehart of Silver Springs, Md.; 

Kenneth Royster of Harrold, Texas, 
Steven Runsick of Ash Flat, Ark., Elizabeth 
Scott of Kingsport, Tenn., Robert Sears of 
Webster Groves, Mo., Rhonda Seay of 
Vernon, Ala., Bret Shirley and Lauri Shirley 

Picker of Searcy, Ark., James Smith of 
Thousand Oaks, Calif., John Smith of El 
Dorado, Ark., Kimberly St. Clair of 
Louisville, Ohio; 

Yi Li Sung of Morgan Hill, Calif., James 
Sutton of Marion, III., Douglas Townsdin of 
Pine Bluff, Ark., Gary Turner of Flint, 
Mich., Kathryn Waite of Huntsville, Ala., 

Barbara Walker of Fraziers Bottom, W. 
Va., Brenda Wheaton of Burton, Mich., and 
Wade Wilkinson of Hatch, N.M. 

To earn membership, students must have 
a 3.70 grade point average on 80 to 103 
hours of credit or a 3.50 average on 104 
hours or more. 

T.uitlon to Increase FiVe Percent 
For 1985-86 School Year 

A five percent across the board increase 
in costs for the 1985-86 school year has been 
approved by the Harding Board of Trustees, 
according to Lott Tucker, vice president for 
finance. 

"Inflation is still a very relll, constant 
problem that we face," Tucker said, "and 
the administration is stri!ing to implement 
cost saving programs whenever possible." 

According to Tucker rising costs of 
utilities, equipment, supplies and labor are 
factors in the situation. 

"We are addressing the utility problem 
directly," he said. "We are investigating 
and developing a plan for co-generation to 
produce our own electricity and the savings 
cou,d be very significant." 

Fall tuition will be $101.50 per semester 
hour. Costs of housing, . registration and 
food will increase approximately five 
percent. 

For the school year 1985·86 a -boarding 
student at HarcJing who takes 15 hours per 
semester can expect to meet all regular 
expenses (tuition, fees, room and board) for 
$5,266.50 to 55,513. A non-boarding 
student can meet tuition and fees for 
53,247.50. 

"Differences would occur depending 
upon which dormitory and which cafeteria 
was selected," Tucker said. "Adjustments 
would also have to be made for taking more 
or less than a 15 hour load." 

Tucker encouraged parents and 
prospective students to contact the -Ad­
mission office for assistance in obtaining 
financial aid and scholarship information. 
(W ATS lines for the Admissions office are 

800-632-4751 for Arkansas and 800-643· 
3792 for all other states except Hawaii and 
Alaska.) 

ON 'J'HE COVER: Former Chancellor of 
West Germany Helmut Schmidt closes the 
1985 American Studies Lecture Series April 
9. Following his lecture, Schmidt presented 
the George Washington honor medtU, 
awarded to the University's program by the 
Freedoms Foundation of Valley Forge, Pa .• 
to Dr. David- Burks. program coordinator. 
The honor medal is the principle award 
given in the Community Programs category. 

Schmidt served as chancellor of West 
Germany from 1974-19'82. He came to the 
position after serVing (l3 Joint Minister in 
earlier governments. 
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New England Tour Planned 
For Alumni and Friends 

A Harding University Alumni and 
Friends bus tour to New England will be 
conducted Sept. 23-0ct. 3 ,with Dr. Jimmy 
Carr as coordinator. 

"Our alumni have expressed interest in 
this type of program," Carr said, "and the 
University is anxious to provide the op­
portunity. " 

The ll-day tour will , originate in Searcy 
with a stop in Memphis to pick up par­
ticipants, with the first night's stay in Ef­
fingham, Ill. 

The group will tour Indianapolis, Ind., 
with lodging in St. Clairsville, Ohio and wU.l 
visit Niagara Falls on the third day. After 
viewing the American and Canadian Falls 
from the Panasonic Tower, the group will 
spend a night in Niagara Falls, Canada. 

Traveling the New York State Thruway to 
Syracuse, the tour will arrive at Thousand 
Islands of the St. Lawrence Seaway at the 
Eastern end of Lake Ontario and will cruise 
through the islands with a night's stopover 
in Alexandria Bay. N.Y. 

The fifth day the group will dtive through 
the Adirondack Mountains, stopping in ' 
Lake Placid, the site of the 1980 Wmter 
Olympics and the 500 million year old 
Ausable Chasm. The tour group will journey 
to Lake Champlain and ferry to Burlington, 
Vt. for the night. 

A circle tour of the Green Mountains will 
include stops at the 150-year old covered 
bridge at Waitsfield, the state capitol at 
Montpelier and other historic sites. 

The tour will continue across the Con-

necticut River into New Hampshire to the 
White Mountains and Franconia Notch, 
including an aerial tramway ride to Cannon 
Mountain. After a trip to the "Old Man ' of 
the Mountain" phenomenon at Profile 
Lake, the night's lodging will be in Littleton, 
N.H. 

After a drive to Boston, the group will 
visit places such as the Boston Common, 
USS Constitution, Old North Church, 
Beacon Hill and Back Bay before stopping 
for the night. 

A drive through Rhode Island and 
Connecticut will end in New York City, 
where free time will be a part of the fare. 
The next day a sight-seeing tour of Times 
Square, the United Nations Building, the 
Statue of Liberty and other significant 
points' of interest will be made before 

-driving to Grantsville, Md. for the night. 
The return route will include travel 

through West Virginia, with the final night 
at Bardstown, Ky., site of Stephen Foster's 
"Old Kentucky Home." 

After travel through "Music City, USA" 
Nashville, Tenn., the group will return to 
Searcy. 

Carr said the ll-day tour will be limited 
to approximately 40 persons and will cost 
5853. A 525 deposit to Harding Alumni and 
Friends New England Tour may be made to 
Box 1224, Harding University, Searcy, Ark. 
72143. 

Further information may be obtained 
through World Travel Agency of Searcy 
(501-268-4291) or from the University. 

Muncy to Visit Efal, ' Israel 
Dr. Raymond Muncy, chairman of the 

department of history and social science, 
will present a paper on "Sex and Marriage 
in Utopian Communities" in Israel, where 
he has been invited for an International 
Conference on "Kibbutz and Communes -
Past and Future" at Efal beginning May 19. 

Muncy was invited by the Yad Tabenkin 
Institute for the Conference, which is 
sponsored by the Israeli government and 
directed by the Department of Jewish 
History at the University of Tel-Aviv. 

The professor will join Utopian scholars 
from Holland, Denmark, Norway, Ger­
many, Belgium, Switzerland, France and 
Australia to spend three days reading 
papers and attending workshops. The 
participants will then visit. the various 
kibbutzim and later each will spend five 
days living in one. Muncy will be at the Beka 
Valley Kubbutz near Jericho, and later will 
be the guest of the Israeli government to 
travel to historical sites. He will return to the 
United States May 30. 

Dr. Muncy wrote a book entitled "Sex 
and Marriage in Utopian Communities," 
published first by Indiana University Press 
and later in paperback by Pengui"n Press. 
The volume has drawn attention of Utopian 
scholars and communal experiments 
throughout the world .. 

His thesis, that monogamous familism 
militates against the collective idea and 
contributes to the demise of communes, is 
one that drew considerable criticism when 
published, particularly in the New York 
Times review of Aug. 12, 1973. 

However, the thesis was, as Muncy 
claimed, historically verifiable for the 19th 
Century experiments, and has proved to be 
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Raymond Muncy 
the major cause for the failure of mOre 
recent communal experiments. 

Muncy also has authored a history of 
Searcy, written for the Bicentenniel, entitled 
"A Frontier Town Grows Up With 
America," and has written. chapters' for 
several other publications. He has received a 
Mellon Fellowship at Rice University to 
study "Crime and Punishment in History." 

Dr. Dean Priest, Dean of the College of 
Arts and Sciences, said of the invitation, 
"This is indeed a great honor. We have long 
since recognized Ray Muncy as a great 
teacher, and we are pleased that he has 
received widespread recognition as an 
author. Now we are especially thrilled to 
have him recognized internationally as 
well." 

Fall foliage makes the New England states beautiful in autumn. Tall trees and peaceful rivers 
highlight the New England landscape. 

Yates Scholarship Established 
A scholarship fund to .honor the memory 

of'J:imothy Edward Yates, who died in 1980 
of heart failure after his freshman year at 
Harding, has been established by his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. G. D. Yates of 
Memphis. 

In addition to honoring the memory of 
their son, the fund was set to encourage and 
reward academic excellence at Harding. 

"This is a tremendously loving and 
unselfish example on the part of EI~je and 
Gerald Yates," said AI Fowler, di~or of 
development, "and we salute this {atnily for 
their desire to help young people to achieve 
at Harding." 

Qualifications for eligibility include the 
following: A student must be at least a 
junior; the student must be majoring in 
mathematics, computer science, biological 
science or physical science; the student must 
maintain a 3.4 grade point average in his 
major field and a 3.2 overall. 

Students intereSted in making application 
for the grant should .inquire through the 
office of Dr. Dean Priest. Dean of the 
College of Arts and Sciences. 

A committee of Dr. Neale Pryor, Vice 
President for Academic Affairs; Jan Renee 
Cramblett, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Yates; 
and David Cramblett, their son-in-law, will 
administer the fund. 

When choosing applications, the com­
mittee will also consider demonstrated 
capability and potential for service to the 
Lord's work. 

Initially a junior will be chosen and the 
scholarship will be renewed for the senior 

,year if he maintains qualification. In the 
. second year, an additional junior recipient 
: will be selected with the same renewal 

understanding. 
Listing Of the scholarship has been added 

to the University catalog, and recipients will 
be announced upon selection. 

CAMPUS CALENDAR 
Harding Permanent Collection Art Show ............ . . . ~ , :.' . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. April 1-12 
Youth Forum/Spring Sing Weekend : ................. .... . ; .. . . . .. . .. . . . .. April5-6 
Melanie Folette Art Show ... " ........ ...... . ...... ...... .. .... .... . .. " April7-12 
American Studies Speaker: Helmut Schmidt ............ . .. . .... .... , . . . . . . . .. April 9 
"Wings" - One-act play .. , .............. . .... . , .... . .. .. . ... . ..... ... April15-18 
Mary Williamson Molnar Art Show ......... ........... ..... ... .. ...... .. April21 -26 
Billie Albany Art Show . ................... . . . .. ..... .... . . . . ..... .. . April 28-May 3 
Spring Commencement .. ... ..... , . .. .. : . .... , .... . ....... ... : ..... .. . ...... May 12 
Intersession Begins .... . ............. . . ... : ; .... . .. ..... .. , ..... . , . .. , ... , May 13 
Faulkner Study Tour in Oxford, Miss . . . .. . , : ............. : . ' .' . . . . . . . . . . . .. May 27-28 
Nigerian Christian Hospital Program ................. ... . ..... .. . .... May 13-July II 
Physical Science Computer Workshop - "Interfacing" . ... . ........ . ....... May 13-26 
French Work/Study Tour ........................... ... . ..... . .. . . , ... .. May 14-28 
Latin i\merican Work/Study Tour in Venezuela ........ .. . ... ... .. ..... May 31-July \1 
Youth Citizenship Seminar. ; .................. . .... . . .... .. . . ... . .... . .. . . June 9-14 
Elderhostel First Session ......... . .... . . :. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. June 9-14 
Diagnosis and Correction of Reading Difficulties Workshop . ... , .. , . . . . . . . .. June 10-26 
First Summer School Session Begins ............ , .. .. .. . .. ........ . ... , ..... ' June 10 
First Early Orientation Session . ...................... .. . : . , . . ' . c. _ • ••. , .•• • June 13-15 
Elderhostel Second Session .................... , ... . ... ,., .... ,. ........ June 23-28 
UPLIFT - (Week-long Bible Camp) ....................... , ..... ........ June 23-28 
Clinical Reading Workshop ....................... '. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. June 27-July 12 
Searcy Summer Dinner Theatre - "Blithe Spirit" ......... , . , , . .. , . . . . . . . .. June 27-29 
Tahkodah Christian Camp ........ .. . , .. . , , . .. , , . . . . .. . . ... ' . C ' • • • • • •• June 23-July 5 
Microcomputers in Education Workshop .......... , ... , . .... : " . . , . , ....... . July 1-12 
Tahkodah Christian Camp ......................... . . ..... .. ... .... .. ..... July 7-19 
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High school students chosen for the High School Bowl AII·Star team are Carol Coffry, Stefan 
Brownfield, John Treat, David Lane and Andy Beatles. (photo by Brad Watson) 

Harding Academy Wins High School Bowl 
Harding Academy of Searcy captured 

first place and Christian Academy of 
Greater St, Louis, Mo. took second after two 
days of competition, Feb. 22·23, in Har· 
ding's second High School Bowl - a team· 
competition event in which knowledge of the 
Bible is tested. 

Harding Academy finished at the top of 
the field at the end of the semi·round·robin 
tournament in which 15 Christian high 
school teams competed. Five southern states 
were represented among the . High School 
Bowl teams. 

"The level of competition was extremely 
high," stated Chris Dell, a Harding Ad· 
missions Counselor and coordinator for 
High School Bowl. "All the teams showed a 
high level of knowledge, which provided for 
some close matches." 

Apart from the competition, High School 
Bowl activities included tours of the 
campus, an ample amount of free time and 

F A c u 

free entertainment which included a student 
talent show, movies and an awards banquet 
at a local restaurant. Team winners and an 
all·star team were announced at the 
banquet with winning team members and 
all·stars receiving certificates and Harding 
scholarships. 

Members of the winning team received 
$SOO scholarships for use during their first 
year at Harding. All·stars received $300 
scholarships. 

The Harding ACi demy tea.m c{)nsisted of 
John Treat, MeUt Diles, Scott Throck· 
morton, Lisa Und rwood and Trace Bird ." 
song. The Ch~istilw .Academy team in· 
cluded Andy Basford, Gary Lyons, Dennis 
Dyes, Andy Beadles and Lisa Balentine. The 
all·sta:rs were Carol Coffey, Stefan 
Brownfield, David Lane and Andy Beadles. 

Other participating teams were: Harding 
Academy of Memphis, Tenn., Ezell· 
Harding Christian School of Antioch, 

L T y 

Lavon Carter 
Lavon Carter - Assistant Professor of Management. B.S. (1967) Harding University; 
M.B.A. (1970) University of South Carolina. 

Lavon Carter grew up on a {arm in South 
Georgia, where he learned the meaning and 
value of hard work. 

He utilized that experience, scrubbing 
and cleaning on the maintenance crew while 
earning a degree, magna cum laude, at 
Harding, where he also met anC! married 
Leah Michaels. . 

After graduation, graduate school and six 
years with Washington Post organizations, 
he, feeling a debt to and believing in 
Christian education, returned to teach, 
bringing Leah and daughters, Ladonna, 
Lisa, Laura, Latina alid Lacinda. 

At - where else - Letona, the family 
purchased a US-acre farm, because he "felt 
strongly that the girls learn what work is all 
about." That philosophy, helping others 
leafD to reason and think, is his thrust for 
the students in his business, economics and 
management courses. 

At the farm, dubbed "Achin' Acres" by 
Leah, the Carters run cattle (all the girls can 
milk), produce, kill, cure and smoke meat 
(HI had two big pieces of our bacon for 
breakfast"), plant and harvest squash, corn 
peas and strawberries, can SOO quarts of 
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produce and fill two freezers each summer. 
In addition, Leah has worked full time at 

the College Inn, but recently dropped t{) 
three days a week when participation in 
sports activities at Hardi.ng Academy, where 
four of the girls are involved, taxed the time 
limit beyond maximum. Until recently, 
Lavon was full·time minister of the Letona 
Church of Christ. 

Last fall the farm became somewhat an 
extension of the University as the Carters 
developed a service opportunity for social 
clubs. 

Growing from an inquiry by a club or two, 
the Carters offered a "Hayride Plan" for 
club functions. For a fee, clubs went to the 
farm, where a bonfire and weiner roast with 
all the trimmings waited. After the meal, 
served and serviced by the girls, Carter 
hooked up the tractor and pulled the 
couples on a long, fun ride around the farm. 
"We had about 20 of those," he recalls. 

Just this semest~r, Lavon has passed his 
orals for the doctorate at Memphis State 
University. The next step will be writing his 
dissertation. The topic? Management, of 
course. 

Memorial To Honor Former Teacher 
Mary Ann Harris, a professor of 

education, died Feb. 11 after a five·year 
battle against cancer. Dr. Harris had taught 
through the fall semester, but was 
hospitalized early in January. 

The 52·year-old professor was a 1954 
graduate of Harding, having served as Bison 
editor two years. She later was assistant to 
Publicity Director Russ Simmons two years. 

In 1957 she was married to Jack D. Harris 
and the couple resided in Illinois and later 
in Memphis, where she taught in the public 
schools several years. She received the 
doctorate at Memphis State and in 1978 
joined the Harding faculty. 

Her colleague, Betty Ulrey, said of her, 
"Mary Ann was one of our finest teachers, 
receiving the Distinguished Teacher Award 
in 1983. She told me that her love of writing 
had helped her in teaching on all levels, 
from elementary school to university 
graduate courses. Her love of music was 
incorporated with her love of children in her 
doctoral dissertation as she studied the 
effect of the Orff music technique on 
teaching exceptional children. ,. 

"I will always remember one shining 
moment in chapel last fall as -she stood 
before 3,000 people, pulling herself up to 

Tenn., Madison Academy of Huntsville, 
Ala., Mars Hill Bible School of Florence, 
Ala., Living Word Academy of Oklahoma 
City, Okla.; 

Green County Christian Academy of 
Tulsa, Okla., Metro Christian of Ft. Smith, 
Ark., West Memphis Arkansas Christian, 
Central Arkansas Christian of North Little 
Rock, Ark., Crowley's Ridge Academy of 
Paragould, Ark., Ouachita Christian School 
of Monroe, La:,' and Shreveport,' La. 
Christian School. 

F I L E 

Mary Ann H.arris 

her maximum height of five feet, to thank 
all of the Harding family for prayers and 
expressions .of concern during her illness. 
She inspired us not only by her sincere 
words, but also be her courage." 

Other survivors include two sons, Bob of 
Harrison and Lee of Memphis; her mother 
and stepfather, Margaret and Carney 
Moore of Memphis; a brother, Robert 
Whitaker of Nashville, Tenn. and two 
grandchildren. 

Funeral services were held at the College 
Church of Christ by Evan Ulrey, who had 
performed the Harrises' wedding ceremony, 
Bobby Coker and Jimmy Allen. Burial was 
in Oak Lawn Cemetery in Searcy. 

A Mary Ann Harris Fund has been 
established in the School of Education, with 
a scholarship to assist students in the field 
of education will be awarded. Memorial 
contributions to the fund should be made 
payable to Harding University with notation 
for the' Mary Ann Harris Fund. 

University ,Band 
Seeks Bassoonist 

Band Director J. Warren Casey is seeking 
bassoonists for the Harding band, and 
takers can have bonus incentive in the form 
of a scholarship from the department of 
music. 

The band will close out the school year 
with an Awards Banquet set for April 28, 
culminating a year of activity in four areas. 

Beginning in the fall, the group becomes 
the Marching Band to play and perform for 
all home football games and halftime shows. 

With the onset of varsity basketball, a 
Pep Band is organized_ to play for the 
round ball games. 

During the spring semester, the Concert 
Band and Jazz Band rehearse for presen· 
tations on tour and for the Spring Sing 
shows, respectively. This spring the group 
made a trip to Northeast Arkansas and 
Missouri high schools, ane next spring's 
tour has been scheduled for Colorado and 
the Midwest. 

In addition to the Spring Sing shows, the 
Jazz Band accompanies the hosts and 
hostesses on tour, this spring to the Houston 
area. Also this spring the Jazz Band par­
ticipa:ted in a Jazz Festival in Wichita, 
Kans. 

With the '86 spring tour yet flexible, 
Casey has encouraged alumni who would 
wish to host the group to contact him at Box 
913 for arrangements. 

HARING UNIVERSITY 



Ernie Addington completes her student teaching requirements at Searcy Junior High. 

Late Career Start No Deterrent; 
'Addington Builds Honors Degree 

By Alice Ann Kellar 
Several yeats ago Bald. Knob homemaker 

Frances Ernie Addington, frustrated, bored 
and confused, picked up on a segment of a 
Little Rock talk show that changed her life 
mto one of self-confidence and satisfaction. 

On May 12 she will pick up a diploma in 
Rarding's spring commencement exercises, 
and she's so completely captivated by her 
accomplishment that she's ready to take to a 
soapbox to encourage other women she 
thinks would benefit from her. experience. 

At 39, Ernie has completed a Bachelor of 
Arts degree with a political science major 
and a history minor. En route she compiled 
a creditable 3.5 grade point average, earned 
membership in Alpha Chi, and has been 
selected for inclusion in Who's . Who. In 
addition, she has become a bona fide 
proponent of Christian .education, citing her 
personal spiritual development and that of 
her family as examples. 
. "I am so happy I've done this," the at­
tractive lady bubbles. "The classroom has 
Qpened a whole new world for me. I know 
there are many women thinking 'Is this all 
there is' and leading desperate, empty 
lives." 

Ernie and Wilburn Addington married 
soon after she finished high sChool and 
moved to the Chicago area, where activities 
and opportunities for cultural development 
or entertainment were plentiful. Ten years 
later, when family circumstances' deemed it 
advisable, they, with children Alex and 
Rachel, moved back to Arkansas. Wilburn 
started a heating and air conditioning 
business in Augusta. . 

Ernie was not prepared for the change 
and was 'terribly unhappy,' she admits. 
"I'm ashamed to admit it," she 
acknowledges, "but I felt I had to do 
something. " 

When the Addingtons decided to move 
their business to Bald Knob, Ernie delved 
into volunteer and civic work, serving on 
various committees and as president of a 
garden club. The business continued, as it 
does yet, to flourish. Things were looking 
up. 

When she heard Little Rock weatherman 
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. Tom Bonner and the Arkansas Symphony 
Conductor Kurt Klipstatter during one 
noon hour, she became most interested. The 
two were touting !!eason ti~kets to the 
Symphony. 

"I got excited just thinking about having 
some place to go. It wasn't that I wanted to 
hear the Symphony, for I'd never been to an 
orchestra concert in my life," she smiles. 

Wilburn agreed to the idea and the 
tickets were ordered. But the results were 
n.ot so satisfying. 

"I came from a family of seven, and there 
had been no funds for musical training," 
she explains. "Wilburn enjoyed' the con­
certs, because he had a good music 
background, but for me it was a total 
disaster." 

Not easily discouraged, however, the 
searching Mrs. Addington hit upon the idea 
of taking a course in music appreciation at 
Harding University. "I'm surprised I even 
knew there was such a course," she recalls. 

Even that step caused concern and 
confusion for her, for she didn't have a good 
image of Harding. "Frankly, I was hesitant 
because I was afraid I would break a rule 
and get kicked out. I smile now when I think 
back to that - but that is truly the way I 
felt." 

However, she found something entirely 
and completely different. The professor led 
a prayer to start the class; he shed tears as 
he related a recent death on campus. "I 
couldn't believe it; it was a wonderful in­
troduction to Harding and to a new world 
for me," she says. 

Ernie was also impressed with the bright, 
young people and took note of their nice 
attire, their polish, their, friendship and 
their love. 

Her enthusiasm, coupled with study, 
resulted in an A for the course. Next she 
tackled History of Western Civilization and 
again a new world opened up. "I loved 
history, and the teacher was so interesting 
that the world became real to me. I started 
reading Newsweelf,; magazine and un­
derstanding what I read . . . it was won­
derful." 

Ann Sewell and Neva White (music) attended the Arkansas State Music Teachers Associa­
tion and the South Central Division of the National Association in Conway. Both are board 
members of the ASMT A and students, Ramona Dallas and Laura Rice, participated in the 
Festival. Bob Reely (management) was chosen President of the North Arkansas Personnel 
Association for 1985. Ed Sanders (Bible) was appointed Department Editor for Voice of 
Freedom, a full page on religious cults in each issue. 

Bruce Cook (communication) won third place and $100 in the 5th Annual F. Hampton 
Roy History Awards sponsored by the Pulaski County Historical Society. Earl Cobill 
(political science) attended the Arkansas Political Science Associiltion Annual meeting in 
Russellville on the Arkansas Tech University campus. Raymond Muncy (history) read a 
paper entitled "Huey P. Long's Invasion of Arkansas" at the Stone County Historical 
Association meeting at the Arkansas Folk Center in Mountain View, Ark. 

Reely Cook Higginbotham Malone 

Avon Malone (Bible) spoke at the Annual Fort Worth Lectures at Brown Trail School of 
Preaching on the subject, "Motive and Morality." Jerry Myhan (nursing) made a health 
survey trip to Haiti to assess the need for a health clinic in that area. Bobby Coker (educa­
tion) attended the National Meeting of the American Association of Colleges for Teacher 
Education in Denver, Colo. Van Tate (sociology) spoke at the African Christian Hospitals 
Foundation meeting in Dallas, Texas on the subject "The Need for Cultural Awareness." 

Ann Schol (personnel) attended the Dun & Broadstreet seminar on "Basic Office Eti­
quette) in Little Rock, Ark. ,Loleta Higginbotham (hGme economics) served on the State 
Future Homemakers of America Scholarship Committee in Little Rock, Ark. Louise Brad­
ford (nursing) presented one day of psychiatric nursing at the Nursing Board Review in 
Boston, Mass., for the A~erican Journal of Nursing Company. Paul Pollard (Bible) gave 
five lectures at the University Christian Student Center in Oxford, Miss. for their annuallec­
tureship. 

Northwest Arkansas Alumni and Friends Meet 
Alumni and friends of the University 

from northwest Arkansas met for an 
evening of fun at the Arts Center of the 
Ozarks in Springdale, Ark. The Winter 
Dinner Party was organized so that' old 
friends might have an opportunity to get 
reaquainted and meet others associated 
with Harding. 

Em Olivia Bevis Speaks 
At Campus'Workshop 

"Strategies for Teaching Nursing in the 
Oassroom" was the theme of a workshop 
March 7-8 at the Harding University School 
of Nursing. 

Designed for nurse-educators in schools 
of nursing or service agencies, the workshop 
focused on ways t~ ~evelop active learning 
strategies fo~ teaching, and group work was 
included to analyze concepts and devising 
learning strategy. 

Em Olivia Bevis, head of the department 
of nursing at Georgia Southern College in 
Statesboro, was the workshop moderator. 

From that point; bolstered by Wilburn 
and her children, now teen-agers, she was 
hooked and eventually became a full time 
student. "It was harder then, being enrolled 
for more courses, . keeping up with duties at 
home and commuting the 13 miles each 
day," she recalls. But she never looked 
back. 

She also ignored a physical imperfection 
that would have discouraged anyone looking 
for an excuse. Vision in her right eye is so 
poor that it is incorrectable; her left eye is 
20/1000 - correctable with a contact. As a 
child, she, with her twin sister, spent three 

Tommy Bush, chairman of the 
President's Development Council for north­
west Arkansas, coordinated the event at­
tended by approximately . 80 friends, 
parents, alumni, President's Development 
Council members and two Board members, 
Paul Carter and Don Shores. 

The evening was filled with activities 
including entertainment by Harding 
musical group, The Time of Day. Dawn 
Zoller from the admissions office spoke on 
why Harding needs students and Assistant 
to the President, Jimmy Carr presented a 
campus report. Dr. Ken Davis provided 
special entertainment by conducting a 
group of former Belles and Beaux members 
and A Cappella chorus members. 

Ann Dixon spoke on behalf of Associated 
Women for Harding to report on efforts 
being made to re-establish active chapters of 
the organization in the northwest area. 

Carter: Harding's newest Board member, 
made the evening's closing remarks and 
challenged each individual to become more 
actively involved in the University's events. 

years at the Arkansas School for the Blind 
in Little Rock. But she doesn't bother much 
with such minor details. 

She much prefers to enjoy her situation 
and share her excitement for the future. 
And to talk about Harding. 

Obviously she's been successful. Son Alex 
is completing . his freshman year, and 
Rachel, a graduating senior, has already 
been . accepted for registration this fall. 

Ernie herself is completing ~upervised 

teaching at Searcy Junior High and looking 
for a teaching job for the fall, adding, "With 
two children in college, I think I'd better!" 
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President Clifton L. Ganus Jr. crowns Kristen Beeson Winter Festival queen during halftime 
ceremonies at a BiSon basketball game. (photo by Yo Kurabayashi) 

Beeson· Named Winter Queen 
Sophomore Kristen Beeson of Jonesboro, 

Ark. received the crown as 1985 Winter 
Festival Queen, Feb.U, during ceremonies 
sponsored by GAT A social club to raise 
money for sending children to summer 
camp. 

Miss Beeson, the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jan Beeson, was crowned by Harding 
president Dr. Clifton L. Ganus Jr. during 
half-time of the Harding University­
Hendrix College basketball game. She was 
attended by four class representatives and 

the other two queen nominees, Kellee Citty 
and Sandi Garner. 

Miss Citty, the'daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Citty of Searcy, Ark., is a junior and was 
homecoming queen in 1983. A sophomore, 
Miss Gamer is the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Marvin Garner of Greenville, IU. 

Qass rep~tatives were: Senior Donna 
Cash of Carmel, Ind.; junior Tracy Willard 
of West Plains, Mo.; sophomore Amber 
Owens ·of Jacksonville, Ark., and freshman 
Cara DuVall of Leitchfield, Ky. 

The National Shakespeare Company performs "Two Gentlemen o/Verona" as a part o/the 
University Lyceum series. (phOto by Yo Kurabayashi) 
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Pioneer Christian Educator, 
Admin,istrator Succumbs 

Adlai Stevenson Croom, 92, one of the 
earliest innovators of Christian education in 
the state of Arkansas and a pioneer ad­
ministrator of Harding, died Feb. 16 in 
Searcy. He was President of Arkansas 
Christian College at Morrilton from 1922 to 
1924 and Vice President of Harding College 
1924-25. 

Croom was born in Oxford, Ark., in 1892. 
,Both his parents were originally from 
Tennessee, but' moved to Arkansas while 
they were very young. His early education 
was limited to elementary as no high school 
facility was available. He completed 
secondary school work, however, in Hen­
derson, Tenn., and subsequently attended 
the University of Louisville from 1915 to 
1919. His master's degree was complet~ at 
HaJ:Vard University in 1922. 
. Following his work with Arkansas 
Christian and Harding College, Croom 
taught for four years at Washburn College 
in Topeka, Kan., during which time he also 
preached for the Topeka church. During the 
next 17 years, he served as a manager for 
Equitable Life of New York insurance 
company in Enid, Okla. 

Croom supported himself through these 
secular jobs, but had been primarily in­
terestedin his work as a preacher since 
1914. He began the first congregation of the 
Lord's church at Enid while working there 
- beginning with about a dozen women 
and children and growing to about 200 
members before he left in 1948. 

From 1949 until his. retirement in 1957, 
Croom served as business manager at 

- Hardhiir College which had already moved 
to Searcy. Since that time, he devoted 
himself exClusively to preaching and 
writing. During his 60 years of preaching, he 
served more than 130 churches in 16 states. 

A.S. Croom . 

During his last years in Searcy, Croom 
continued his interest in Christian 
education and was frequently found 
speaking or leading prayer during the 
college lectureships and religious forums. 
Very alert at age 92, he was a delight to 
audiences with his grammatical exactness 
and his witty evaluations of himself. 

Bro. Croom had more than 250 articles 
published in brotherhood papers and had 
authored four books. 

He had been marri~ for 62 years to 
Margaret Price Croom, who followed him in 
death on March 21. They had three 
child.-en, John A. Croom of Edmond, Okla.; 
Dr. William S. Croom of Lubbock, Texas; 
and Sarah Croom Hatch of Boulder, Colo.; 
nine grandchildren and three great grand­
children. 

Both funeral services were held at the 
College Church of Christ. 

University News Briefs ... 
Uniyenity employees contributed a 

record of $6,519.19 to the Wbite County 
United Way fund drive which exceeded its 
goal of $164,000 by $9,000. President 
Clifton Ganus accepted for Harding a Gold 
Award in recognition of outstanding 
support given by the school. 

Divisions which had 100 percent par­
ticipation included admissions, English, 
music, alumni office, financial aid, 
president's office, biology, foreign language, 
psychology, bookstore employees, health 
center, recording studio, bowling lanes staff, 
history, registrar's office, School of 
Business; 

Home ecoJ}omics, sociology, comptroller's 
office,· housing staff, speech, academic 
computer office. library staff, student 
personnel, administrative computer office, 
math,. science, development staff, media 
center and the vice president for finance 
office.· 

The Ninth Annual Preachers' Forum of 
tbe Harding Graduate Scbool of Religion is 
scheduled for April 16, 1985 from 9:00 a.m. 
until 4:30 p.m.,' . 

Dr. Harold Hazelip, Dean of the Harding 
Graduate School of Religion, will be the 
featured speaker on Christian Ethics at the 
Margins of Life. His three lectures are 
entitled Making Moral Decisions, Issues 
Surrounding Birth and Issues Surrounding 
Death. 

Rodney Slater, special assistant for Com- . 
munity and Minority Affairs in Arkansas, 
spoke on the campus Feb. 19 as a part of 
the observance of Black History Month at 
the University. " 

Sponsored by Skotia Club at Harding, the 
program included a presentation by 
students portraying prominent black 
leaders. 

To conclude the week's activities a Gospel 
Explosion musical program was presented 
in the Heritage Auditorium. Choruses from 
Arkansas, Oklahoma and New York joined 
a local group for the third annual 
presentation. 

Slater served as an assistant Attorney 
General for two years and served as a 
member of the Governor's campaign staff. 

Student members of tbe American 
Studies Program toured Atlanta, Ga., Apnt 
1-4 visiting several corporations. , 

Approximately 47 students accompanied 
.by faculty members David Burks, Earl 
Cobill and David Johnson made the four 
day trip visiting Delta Airline's marketing 
division, Coca Cola, Digital Com­
munications of America. National Service 
Industries; 

American Hospital Supply. Financial 
Services Corporation, Advanced Technical 
& Development Center at Georgia Tech, 
Jackson & Coker, medical recruitment firm, 
Cyclorama, a learning center about the Civil 
War and Atlanta Mayor Andrew Young. 
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Spring Sing '85 
"Our World Is Caving In," a show 

fantasizing prehistoric man by the Regina 
and Chi Sigma Alpha social clubs, took 
sweepstakes honors at the 12th annual 
Spring Sing at Harding University April 4-6, 
following four presentations of the gala . 
musical for audiences numbering ap­
proximately 12,000. The award also in­
cluded $600 cash for the clubs. 

President Clifton L. Ganus Jr. presented 
the sweepstakes trophy at the Benson 
Auditorium for points compiled by a panel 
of 33 judges who scored the shows on the 
basis of theme, costume, choreography and 
music. , 

Shantih, Titans and Kappa Tau Omega 
took second place with "A Spring Sing 
Show," a generic program for cost-cutter 
products. The clubs also received $500. 

Third place honors and $400 went to 

Clockwise: Hostess Geanetta Walker 
solos in "The Joint is Jumpin '. Chi Sigma 
Alpha and Regina present the sweepstakes 
winning production, "Our World Is Caving 
In." Jill Savage performs in "The Joint is 
Jumpin'," Hosts and hostesses lead the 

. finale production wit~ club members from 
the 1985 presentation in "We Are The 
World," along with Shantih, Titans and 
Kappa Tau Omega in "A Spring Sing 
Show." 

1 
TEA 
PJ\r\~ 
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"Dressed to Kill," a show based 'on duck 
hunting, by Sub T-16 and Ko Jo Kai. 
Receiving fourth place and $300 was "Well, 
It's About Time," a show bringing back 
songs from the 20's, SO's, and 80's, 
presented by Zeta Rho and TNT. Fifth place 
honors and $200 went to "Nun of That 
Monkin' Around" by Chi Lambda Chi, 
Sigma Tau Sigma and Kappa Delta Kappa. 

President Ganus, Dr. Neale Pryor and Dr. 
John Ryan, Spring Sing coordinator, 

presented the sweepstakes awards and 1984 
Host David Slater and the 1985 Hosts and 
Hostesses Tim Dill, Brett Phillips, Geanetta 
Walker, and Sharon Healy presented the 
category awards. 

"Our World Is Caving In" captured three 
of the category awards including music, 
costume and choreography. "A Spring Sing . 
Show" was awarded best theme and "Nun 
of That Monkin' Around" had the best 
participation. 
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ALUMNOTES 
CLASS OF 1949 

Marie Massey Baker (BA) is retired after 
having taught high school English and 
served as librarian in the public schools. Her 
husband. J.C .• is a Polled Hereford breeder. 
Their address is Box 113; Imboden, Ark. 
72434. 

CLASS OF 1957 

J. Paul DuBois (BA) is a financial planner 
and manager of the Fort Worth, Texas 
office of Waddell and Reed. Inc.' Mr. 
DuBois resides with wife, Marcia. at 2408 
Villa Vera: Drive, Arlington, Texas 76017. 

••• 
Judge Alan Highers of Henderson, Tenn., 

a judge of the Court of Appeals in Jackson, 
was one of three persons recommended by 
Congressman Don 'sundquist for ap­
pointment to the new U.S. District Court for 
West Tennessee. He has served as secretary, 
vice-president, and is currently the 
president of the state Judicial conference. 

CLASS OF 1959 

Robert Ham (aA) earned the doctor's 
degree in education administration from 
Duke University in December, 1984. Hain 
teaches seventh grade science at Martin 
Middle-School. He and his wife, the former 
Betty Neill (BA'60), have two daughters, 
Nancy and Linda, and reside at 417 Warren 
Ave., Cary, N.C. 27511. 

CLASS OF 1964 
Jon R. Farris (BA), associate professor 

and chairman of theater and cinema at 
Denison University, Granville, Ohio, has 
been granted tenure. He teaches acting and 
play direction at Denison. Farris and his 
wife, Dagmar, reside at 338 East College 
Street, Granville, 43023. 

CLASS OF 1965 

James I. Penrod, associate vice chancellor 
for information resoilrces at the University 
of Maryland at Baltimore, has been elected 
vice president of CAUSE, the professional 
as.~ociation for computing an~ information 
technology in higher education. At the 
University of Maryland at Baltimore, Dr. 
Penrod is the senior policy officer for 
campus information resQurces man­
agement. Dr. Penrod resides with his wife, 
Ann, at 123 Croydon Road, Baltimore, Md. 
21212. -

CLASS OF 1967 
Peggy Ault Sharpe (SS) does substitute 

teaching in the public schools in Belpre, 
Ohio and is an instructor in nutrition at 
Ohio Valley College, Parkersburg, W.Va~ 
Her husband, Tom, is assistant professor of 
English at Ohio Valley College. The couple 
resides with their three children - Toby, 
Aaron and Travis -- at 800' George St., 
Belpre, Ohio 45714. 
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Charles E. Babb is pr~cess operator with 
E. I. Dupont, Circleville, Ohio. His wife, 
Anita, is purchasing agent with Warren 
Technical Associates. They reside with their 
two children, Kathy and Charles, at 8030 
Stoutsville Pike, Circleville, 43113. 

CLASS OF 1968 

John A. Collins (BA) received the Doctor 
of Arts degree in history from Middle 
Tennessee State University in December, 
1984. Dr. Collins is an instructor in the 
Department of history and political science 
at Freed-Hatdeman College. He and his 
wife, Mary, are the parents of two sons, 
Mark and Justin. The family lives at Route 
I, Mitchell Lane, Henderson, Tenn. 38340 . 

CLASS OF 1969 

Sandra Lenderman Moon (BA) is em­
ployed with the Pennsylvania Department of 
Public Welfare, Somerset, Pa. She and her 
husband, James, have two children, Ben­
jamin Eric and Jennifer Cheryl, and live at 
Route 3, Box 192, Somerset, 15501. 

CLASS OF 1970 

Dr. Jim Carr (SA) of Tallahassee, Fla. has 
recently been elected to the board of 
directors of Comsafe Company. Comsafe_is 
a Jack Nicholas Golden Bear company. Jim 
serves as a member of a seven-member 
board of which Jack Nicholas serves as 
chairman. The company's headquarters are 
in Samford, Conn . 

••• 
Lyn Prince Rose has retired from 

teaching English at Lubbock Christian 
College to be a homemaker. Her husband, 
Ron, serves as minister of adult and family 
education for the Richland Hills Church of 
Christ. They reside with children, Julie and 
Joy, at 5001 Surrey Court, North Richland 
Hills, Texas 76118. 

••• 
Jo Anne Beck Everhart is a -certified 

interpreter for the deaf and is self employed 
as a free-lance interpreter. She received the 
B.S. degree in deaf education in 1971 from 
the University of T~nnessee. Since then she 
has taught deaf students on all levels. She 
has also taught deaf-blind children. Jo 
Anne's husband, Kenneth, is lab analyst 
with Reynolds Metals Company. The couple 
resides at 1010 Ponder' Street, Corpus 
Christi, Texas 78404. 

••• 
Drake Lee (SS) is employed with K & B 

Drugs and Picayune Convalescent Home, 
Picayune, Miss. as consultant pharmacist. 
His wife, the former Bonnie Lewers (SA'69), 
is business teacher at Picayune Vocational 
Technical Center. The family resides at 
1025 Stemwood, Picayune, 39466. 

CLASS OF 1971 

Linda Hall Coleman (SA) is a part-time 
secretary for her husband, Randy, who is 
youth minister for Pleasant Valley Church 
of Christ, Van Buren, Ark. He also serves on 
the board of Metro Christian' School. The 
couple has three children - Tim, Kristin 
and Karen - and resides at 1005 Thicksten 
Drive, Alma, 72921. 

Dee BO&t conducts GIl evening chus in ma1cing ,tained glD.rs. (photo by Brad Watson) 

Melanie Jane Wilson Timmons is a 
learning disabilities teacher in the public 
schools in Kennett, Mo. She and her 
husband, Bill, reside at 1604 South Lincoln, 
Kennett, 63857. 

••• 
Bruce Stidham (SA) is employed with 

KXII-TV as production manager/creative 
director. He and his wife, the fonner Karen 
Darwin (BS), live at Route 2, Box' 352A, 
Whitewright, Texas 75491. 

••• 
Mary Ann Peden Coviello (SA) is em­

ployed with the Wachovia Bank & Trust 
Company as senior personal banker 
secretary. She and her husband, Jim, reside 
at 3446 Royalton Street, Winston-Salem, 
N.C. 27104. 

••• 
Michael Roy Pruitt (BA) teaches at York 

College and also serves as athletic director . 
He and his wife, the former Christine Long 
(BA'74), resides at 1002 Nebraska Avenue, 
York, Neb. 68467. 

••• 
David Letterman (B.M is employed with 

Ozark National Life Insurance Company 
and is also affiliated with NIS Financial 
Services as securities representative. He and 
his wife, Orvia, live at Route I, Box 415-9, 
Strafford, Mo. 65757. 

••• 
Alison Elmer Keller is technical services 

librarian at Northeastern Christian Junior 
College, Villanovl!:, Pa. She and husband, 
David (M.Th.'74), reside at .437 Weadley 
Road, King of Prussia, 19406. 

••• 
Lindalyn Davis Jarnagin is a registered 

nurse in the intensive care nuniery at 
Jackson Madison County General Hospital. 
Her husband, Bob (SA'70), is a certified 

public accountant. The couple Jives at 
Route 2, Box 144-F, Selmer, Tenn. 38375. 

••• 
Eugene Johnson (BA) is emplQ¥ed with 

Digigraphics Electronics as production 
manager. He is married to the former 
Clementine Blountt (SA) and their address 
is P.O. Box 126, Sherman, Texas 75090. 

• •• 
Larry Sadler is a master sergeant 

stationed at Myrtle Beach Air FQrce BaSe, 
S.C. He recently completed seven years In 
the Air Force Recruiting Service in 
Blytheville, Ark. and Memphis, Tenn. He is 
married to the former Andrea Crownover 
(BA'70) and they have two children, Janna 
andJay. The family lives at 21STarpon Bay 
Road, Myrtle Beach, 29577. 

••• 
Michael W. Hedrick (BA) teaches and 

coaches football at Harding Academy in 
Memphis, Tenn. He and his wife, the former 
Donna Miller ('72), live at 4370 Fizer Cove, 
Memphis, 38117. . 

••• 
Roger Elliott (BA) works as field manager 

with Great Ametican Opp, Inc. He is 
married to the former Linda Hendrickson 
and they Jive at 4502 North 35th Place, 
Phoenix, Ariz. 85018. 

• •• 
CharJie Boaz (BA) is a resident operator 

with Texaco. He aJJd his wife, Linda, live at 
Route I, Box 90, George West, Texas 78022. 

••• 
(3aty W. Bryant is employed with Monroe 

'Systems For Business, Inc. as bran~h 
manage~. He and his wife, Tricia, reside at 
3126 ReisoI Road, No. 109, Shreveport. 
71118. 
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Paula Erwin Brady is pre-school teacher 
at Central Arkansas Cllristian Schools. She 
and her husband, Anthony (BA'69), live at 
110 Goldenwood Dr., Jacksonville, Ark. 
72076. 

••• 
Mrs. - Fran Nichols Messick is 

secretary/office manager for Joe S. Clawson 
& Associates, Inc. (oil field equipment), 
Shreveport, La. She lives with her three 
children - Jenny, Matthew aQd Aaron - at 
919 Chandler Ave., Shreveport, 71107. 

••• 
Ken W. Merritt (BS) is a chartered life 

underwriter with Republic National Life 
Insurance Company. He and his wife, Coe 
Ellen, live in Fayetteville, Ark. Their ad­
dress is P.O. Box 247, Fayetteville, 72702. 

••• 
Kenneth W. Whitelaw (BA) is assistant 

professor of computer information systems 
at Ferris State College. He and his wife, the 
former Bonnie Ruth Taylor ('73), reside at 
21701 Forest Lake Dr., Big Rapids, Mich. 
49307. 

••• 
James C. Brasher works as a diesel 

electrician with Southern Railway. He and 
his wife, Betty Jean, live at Route 1, Box 
174, Rock Spring, Ga. 30739. ... -

James L . .wade (BA) is self eniployed with 
Southern Homes Realty in Huntsville, 
Texas. He lives at 1608 Wildwood, Hunt­
sville, 77340. 

••• 
John W. Owen is employed with the 

'United Parcel Service as program­
mer/analyst. He and his wife, Jeannie, 
reside at 27202 Bradner, Warren, Mich. 
48093. 

••• 
Donna Marie Michener Davis (BA) 

teaches second grade at Ft. Worth Christian 
School. She and her husband, Jerald, live at 
7721 Deaver Drive, Ft. Worth, Texas 76118. 

••• 
Jetty Copeland (BA) is chairman of the 

physical education department at Northeast 
High School in North Little Rock, Ark. He 
is also football and track coach. His wife, 
the former Nita Mullens (BA'70) is physical 
education professor at the University of 
Arkansas at Little Rock. They reside at 10 
Cardinal Valley Drive, North Little Rock, 
72116. 

••• 
Robert ,Paul Lendman is sales trainer 

with Century 21 Crest Realty, Inc., 
Grandview, Mo. He is married to the fonner 
Laura Jean Davis ('73) and they live at 7503 
East 126th Street, Grandview, 64030 . 

••• 
Gary W. Walker is self employed as a 

private investigator and bail bonding. He 
and his wife, Mary, reside at 708 West 
Main, Atlanta, Texas 75551. 

- ... 
Robert Gary Parsons (BA) is a partner in 

the Sunshine Toy Co., Inc. He lives at 2420 
Whitehall St., S.E., Suitland, Md. 20746 . 

••• 
Jimmy Wayne Shawver (BA) is quality 

engineer with Nissan Motor Manufacturing 
Co., Smyrna, Tenn. He and his wife, the 
fonner Nancy Laschinski, reside at Route 8, 
Box 187, Saddle Drive, Murfreesboro, 
Tenn. 37130. 

• •• 
Larry J. Crone (BA) is a sales 'represen­

tative with Waggoner-Shumate Printing. He 
and his wife, the fonner Barbara Cross 
(BA'72), reside at Route I , Box 106, Ben­
tonville, Ark. 72712 . 

••• 
Joe E. McReynolds (BA) serves as senior 

pastor for the White County Christian 
Fellowship. He is married to the fonner 
Sybil Hubbs (BA'74). The family lives at 
Route 3, Box 170-C, Ranchette Village, 
Searcy, Ark. 72143 

••• 
Donna Rish Putnam is a homemaker and 

student pilot with the Civil Air Patrol. She 
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and husband, John, reside at 105 Dro Drive, 
Vicksburg, Miss. 39180. 

••• 
Nancy Cleveland Montgomery (BA) is a 

homemaker and teaches stitchery in the 
Creative Circle. She and ,her husband, 
Michael, live at 5019 C Kaena Loop, 
Wahiawa, Hawaii 96786. 

••• 
Dr. John David. Burleigh (BS) is an or­

thodontist in the U.S. Anny. He is married 
to the fonner Vickie Lynn Bettis ('74) and 
they reside at 6833 Todd, Ft. Hood, Texas 
76544. 

••• 
Thomas D. Robinson (BA) is self em­

ployed as a consultant in nuclear utilities. 
He lives at 605 West J St., No~ 44, 
Russellville, Ark. 72801. 

• •• • 
James B. Miller ' (BA) teaches social 

studies in ' the Marshfield Public Schools, 
Springfield, Mo. He is also a self-employed 
wedding photographer. He is married to the 
fonner Janice Shanks (BA) who is an adult 
education business instructor at Graff Vo­
Tech Center. They reside at 1671 South St. 
Charles, Springfield, 65804. 

••• 
Judy Diann Trimm Julian (BS) is home 

economics teacher at Tate High School, 
Pensacola, Fla. She and her husband, Peter, 
reside at 2124 Oak Stream Ave., Pensacola, 
32506. 

••• 
Dr. W. Mitchell Murphy (BA) is 

elementary principal at Roy Taylor 
Elementary School, Pevely, Mo. He is 
married to the former Susan Elaine FQwler 
(BS) who is a clerical aide in the superin­
tendent's office. They live at 707 Chuck 
Drive, Pevely, 63070. 

••• 
June Esther Armstrong Breezeel is a 

receptionist with Union Electric Company, 
Jefferson City, Mo. She and her husband. 
Gary, reside at 216 nix ROad, Jefferson 
City, 65101. 

••• 
Cheryl Anne Danley Stone (BA) is a 

substitute teacher for the public schools. 
She and husband, Edward Dean, live at 
Route 1, Box 950, Amissville, Va. 22002. 

••• 
Glenda lean Horton (BA) is -first grade 

teacher at Bald Knob Public Schools. She 
lives at 30 Westgate, Searcy, Ark. 72143. 

••• 
Donald F. Johnson (BS) is assistant chief 

pharmacist with the V.A. Medical Center. 

He and his wife, the fonner Diane Thweatt, 
reside at 7 Custer Place, North Little Rock, 
Ark: 72116. 

••• 
Deborah Doggett Reiss (BA) is a social 

worker in Memphis, Tenn. She and 
husband, Raymond, live at 4400 Calypso 
Court, No.3, Memphis, 38118. 

• •• 
Barbara Goetz Bloodworth is a 

bookkeeper with Allen, Davis, Martin & 
Vaughn. CPAs. She and husband, Ted, live 
at Route 4, Goodlettsville. Tenn. 37072. 

• •• 
Harvey W. Mead (BA) is elementary 

principal of Living Word Academy, a 
Christian school in Oklahoma City, Okla. 
He and wife, Julie, reside at 3236 North 
Tulsa, Oklahoma City, 73112. 

••• 
David E. Butterfield (BA) is a teacher and 

coach in the public schools, Vienna, W.Va. 
He is married to the fonner Ann Stephens 
(BA'70) and they live at 1602 Woodland Dr., 
Vienna, 26105. 

••• 
Myra Barr Stevens (BA) is a secretary 

with Rockwell International, Space 
Transportation Systems Div. She and 
husband, Grigs, reside at 303 West Sheila, 
Apt. B. Santa Maria, Calif. 93454. 

••• 
Beverly Wilkinson Scott (BA) is a speech 

and drama teacher. She also. gives teacher 
seminars and workshops. Beverly has 
authored 11 books for Bible school teachers. 
Her husband, Patrick ('72), is employed 
with Halliburton Services as senior 
programmer. They reside with their three 
children - Amy, Christy, and Benjamin­
at 916 West Chestnut, Duncan, Okla. 
73533. 

••• 
Timothy D. Hadley (BA) is . a Bible 

professor at Ohio Valley College, 
Parkersburg, W.Va. He and his wife, Nancy 
Coffman ('73), live at 1322 20th Street, 
Vienna, 26105 . .,. 

David Layton McCown (BA) is corporate 
controller of Centex Corporation, Dallas, 
Texas. He is married to the fonner Teresa 
Mooneyham (BA'74) and they reside at 6916 
Allview, Dallas, 75227. 

••• 
Mary Josephine Stinson Albright (AA) is 

a missionary with husband, Dwight (BA'70), 
in Japan. Their address is 4-13-34 Hon~cho 
Higashi Kurome-shi-Tokyo 203, Japan. 

Charles W. Caffey (BA) is regional sales 
manager for Key Industries, Paragould, 
Ark. He and his wife.' the fonner Jessie 
Jeanette Sims ('69), reside at 303 Pinecrest, 
Paragould, 72450. 

••• 
Virginia Galyan Frederick works as 

secretary and receptionist for her husband, 
Dr. James D. Frederick (BS'68). Their 
address is P.O. Box 607, West Liberty, Ky. 
41472. 

• •• 
Carolyn Knotts Brown (BA) teaches 

fourth grade in the Zanesville, Ohio City 
Schools. She and her husband. Gordon 
(BA·72). live at 1675 Kingswood Circle, 
Nashport, Ohio 43830. 

• •• 
CarQlyn Wilson Graves (BS) is a 

homemaker; her husband, Roger, is in the 
military service. They reside at 5484 Kay 
Circle, Colorado Springs, Colo. 80917. 

••• 
Peggy Tarpley Reeve is learning 

disabilities resource teacher at Charlot­
tesville City Schools, Charlottesville. Va. 
She and husband, Ronald (BA'69), live at 
2216 Banbury Street, Charlottesville, 22901. 

••• 
Cheryl Leckliter Russell works in the 

business office of Harding Academy in 
Memphis. Tenn; She and her husband, 
William (BA), live at 4936 Scottsdale. 
Memphis, 38118. 

• •• 
David ' H. Tidwell (BS) owns Century 

Business I'roducts and is a Savin Copier 
distributor. He and his wife, Mary, live at 
406 East 21st St., Sioux Falls, S.D. 57105. .... 

Virginia Whitten Carden (BA) teaches 
sixth grade at Huntsville City Schools. She 
and husband, Terry, reside at 1009 
Woodbine Road, Madison, Ala. 35758. 

••• 
Jan Wehunt Roberts is a hairdresser at 

The White House Beauty Salon. She resides 
with her husband, Cliff (BA!70), at 160 
Cloverdale. Searcy, Ark. 72143. 

••• 
Philip D. Reagan (BA) teaches in the­

speech department of Oklahoma Christian 
College. He and wife, Louise, live at 524 
Ridgecrest Rd., Edmond. Okla. 73034. 

••• 
Sheran Franklin Milianta (BA) is a 

business education teacher in the public 
schools. She resides with her husband, 
Thomas, at 2879 St. John Dr., Clearwater, 
Fla. 33519. 

The intemationaUy known Flying Karamazov Brothers presented an exciting spring program of juggling and haumcing feats during a March 
lyceum performance. (photo by Brad Watson) 
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(continued from page 9) 
Irene Curtis Hudkins (BA) is a pre­

kindergarten teacher at Parent's Co-op Pre­
School. Battlefield, Mo. She and her 
husband. Arthur (BA'68), live at 3963 
Dahlia. Battlefield. 6~19. 

••• 
Evertt Wayne Huffard (BA) is associate 

professor in religion and missions at 
Pepperdine University. He and his wife, the 
fonner I1eene Johnson (BA), reside at 2461 
Via Nina. Montebello. Calif. 90640. 

••• 
Mary Lou Stites Doming (BA) works as 

offke manager for her husband's law firm. 
She and her husband, .Larry. reside at 104 
West Washington Street, Paris, Tenn. 
38242. 

••• 
Linda Bender (BA) is employed as 

proofreader with Commerce Clearing 
House, Chicago. Ill. She lives at 4117 North 
Major, Chicago, 60634. 

••• 
Alvin Leach (BA) serves as minister for . 

the Chul'ch of Christ in Junction City, Kan. 
He and his wife, the former Carolyn Keck 
('72), live at 506 Country Side, Junction City, 
66441. 

••• 
Gordon R. Sutherlin (BS) is employed 

with the Cabot Public Schools as teacher of 
math and computers and is also district 
computer coordinator. He and his wife, the 
former Cynthia Patchell (BA), live at 33 
Francis Street, Cabot, Ark. 72023. Cynthia 
also teaches math in the public schools 
there. 

••• 
Marilyn Rector Briscoe is accouritant and 

payroll supervisor with Chevron Shipping 
Company, Oakland, Calif. She and her 
husband, Lorenzo, live at 4754 Stacy Street, 
Oakland, 94605. 

••• 
Robert Lynn Calhoun is employed with 

Webb, Murray & Associates, Inc. as fire 
protection technology specialist. He and his 
wife, Julie, reside at 16335 Mill Point, 
Houston, Texas 77059. 

••• 
Thomas A. Walden (BA) is aviation 

technician with Sun. Inc. He and wife, 

Leslie, live at 922 West Avenue F, Garland, 
Texas 75040. 

••• 
Jonesa Cochran Rachal (BA) teaches 

second grade in the public schools. She and 
husband, AI, live at 33 Sundown Drive, 
Morringsport, La. 71060. 

••• 
Janice Britton McAffry (J;lA) teaches first 

grade at Mars Hill Bible School. She lives 
with her husband, James (BA'72) and two 
children, Sally and Bart, at Route 2, Box 
463. Tuscumbia, Ala. 356.74 . 

••• 
Clementine Blountt Johnson (BA) is a 

probation officer with the Grayson County 
Adult Probation Department. She and her 
husband, Eugene (BA), live in' Sherman, 
Texas. Their address is P.O. Box 126, 
Sherman, 75090. 

••• 
Susan Holt Thurman is employed with 

Western Kentucky University as 
speech/language pathologist for the 
diagnostic center. Her husband, Jim ('72), is 
a dentist. They reside with their four 
children - K/lthryn. Carson. Lindsay, and 
Shelley - at 300 West Brown Street, 
Glasgow, Ky. 42141. 

• •• 
Janice Darnell Wiley · (BS) is a 

homemaker; her husband, Ronald. is 
employed with General Electric Company. 
They live at 3701 Alpine Drive, Smyrna. Ga. 
30080. 

••• 
Janet Gregg Mong is self employed as a 

secretary for Seederly-Mong Funeral 
Homes. She lives with her husband, James. 
at 11500 Market Street, North Lima, Ohio 
44452. 

••• 
Timothy C. Lewis (BA) serves as youth 

minister for South MacArthur Church of 
Christ. He is mamed to the former Ann 
Starling (BA) who teaches music. They live 
at 433 Little John, Irving. Texas 15061. 

••• 
Lucretia Woodward Wobton (BA) teaches 

Sixth grade in the public schools, Augusta, 
Kan. She and , her husband, Paul ('70), 
reside at 36 Angelina, Augusta. 67010. 

Johnie Luker (BA) is executive director of 
Christian Family Services of Pacific Nor­
thwest. He and his wife, Virginia, live at 
1250 Downard Lane, Redding, Calif. 96002. 

••• 
David L. Baldridge (BS) is computer 

engineer and co-owner of Compu-Share, 
Lubbock, Texas. He is married to the 
former Amy Ruth Anderson and they reside 
at 54~1 28th Str~. Lubbock, 79407. 

••• 
Kenneth M. Barry (BA) is a supervisor 

with United Parcel Service. He and' his wife, 
·the Jormer Mary Elizabeth Cox ('70), live at 
310 West 5th, Colby, Kan. 67701. 

••• 
Jeffrey Allen Woods (BA) is physics/inath ' 

teacher at Decatur City Schools. He and his 
wife, Deborah, reside at Route 1, Box 239B, 
Madison, Ala. 35758. 

• •• 
'Barbara An~ Oliver (BA) is vice president 

international banking officer of the First 
Tennessee Bank. She lives at 3182 Sharpe, 
Apt. 3, Memphis. Tenn. 38111. 

••• 
Edward E. Rezach Jr. (BA) serves as 

minister for the Church of Christ, Luverne, 
Ala. He and his wife, Pamela, live at 801 
Ridgecrest, Luverne, 36049 . 

••• 
Robert Paul Rushing teaches school at 

Colorado Springs, Colo. He and his wife, -
Taunya, reside at 3280 South Academy 
Blvd., Apt. 181, Colorado Springs. 80916. 

CLASS OF 1972 
Eldon R. England is owner of Eldon's 

Truck Parts & Sales in Searcy, Ark. He and 
his wife, Lanell, live at Route 4, Magee 
Drive, Searcy, 72143 . 

••• , 
Gary Keith Roberts (SA) is maintenance 

, repairman with Cell.tral Arkansas General 
Hospital in Searcy, Ark. He and his wife, the 
former Rhonda Moyer (BA'79), live at 800 
East Market, Searcy, 72143. · 

••• 
Charles H. Anderson (BS) serves as 

Approximately 40 students are spending the spring semester at Harding University in Florence. Italy. ClDsses will conclude April 30. 
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minister for the Covington Road Church of 
Christ, Natchez, Miss. He and his wife, the 
former Pamela Ferguson ('74), reside at 
3501 Eastbrook Road, Natchez, 39120. 

••• 
Ronald D. Roberts (BA) teaches in the 

public schools in' Kenne~, Mo. He is 
married to the former Marla ,Capps (BA) 
and they live at 1612 West Washington; ­
Kennett, 63857. 

••• 
Laudell Burt Massengill (SA) teaches 

math to the seventh and eighth grades in 
the public schools in Clinton, Ark. She and 
husband. Jim, reside at Route 1, Box 44, 
Clinton, 12031. 

••• 
Dr. Gary T. Cage (SA) serves as minister 

for the Wedekind Road Church of Christ, 
Sparks, Nev. He and his wife, Charlotte, 
reside at 3290 Dana Way, Sparks, 89431 • 

, ... 
Pattie Beard Moss (BA) teacltes fifth 

grade in the public schools, Huntsville, Ala. 
She and her husband, Jim (MA'73), reside 
at 2510 Birchfield St., Huntsville, 35810 . 

••• 
Collett Branch Cross (SS) is employed as 

counselor with the public schools, New 
Albany, Miss. She and her husband, 
Thomas, live at 105· Hillcrest Drive. New 
Albany, 38652. 

••• 
Holland Wayne Ray (BS) is religious 

program specialist with the U.S. Navy. He 
and his wife, Anita, live at 5303 Albert St., 
Charleston, S.C. 29418. 

••• 
Robert W. Stephens (MA) is assistant to 

the president at Ohio Valley College, 
Parkersburg, W.Va. He and his wife. 
Ridglae, reside at 4815 Sixth Ave., Vienna, 
26105. 

••• 
Phyllis Ann Clark (MAT) is employed 

with Morgan County Board of Education as 
director of early childhood education. Her 
address is P.O. Box 1025, Athens, Ala. 
35611. 

••• 
Kristina West Coleman (BS) is service 

representative with Arkansas Social Ser­
vices, Hot Springs, Ark. She and her 
husband, Clifton, and family reside at 830 
Bellaire Drive, Hot Springs, 71901. 

••• 
Fred J. Knutson (SA) serves as minister 

for the Bramalea Church of Christ, 
Brampton, Ontario, Canada. He and his, 
wife, Suzanne, live at 26 Ivybridge Drive, 
,Brampton, L6V 2X2. . 

, ... 
James B. Sigmund (BA) is employed with 

the Social Security Administration as 
operations supervisor. He and his wife, the 
former Martha Lynn Williams (BS), live at 
3008 Mimosa. Sherman, Texas 75090 . 

••• 
Mae Wanda Brown is academic assistant 

to the provost of the University of California 
at San Diego. Calif. She lives at 420 Ruxton 
Ave., Spring Valley, 92077 . 

••• 
Judy Andrews Roberts is bookkeeper at 

Ouachita Christian School. Her husband, 
Keith, is minister of the Church of Christ in 
Calhoun, La. They reside at Rotite 1, Box 
533, Calhoun, 71~25 . . 

••• 
Maryann Cooper Felps (BA) teaches 

French at Temple Junior College, Temple, 
Texas. She and her husband, Kelly, reside 
at 609 E. Lamar. Temple, 7650L 

- ... 
Garry L. Pack (BS) is employed with 

Copolymer Rubber & Chemical Cor­
poration in the Process Development 
Department as engineer-emulsion polymers. 
He is married to the former Kathy Jean Clay 
(BA) who is an elementary teacher in the 
public schools. They reside at 4721 South­
wind Drive. Baton Rouge, La. 70816 . 

••• 
Wayne A. Luallen (BA) is X-ray 
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technologist With Visalia Medical Clinic. He . 
and his wife, Donna ('75), reside at 4601 W. 
Laurel Ave., Visalia, Calif. 93277. 

••• 
Elaine Richmond Thompson is in 

electronic sales employed with Foleys. Her 
husb~d, Marty (BS), is a stock broker with 
Dean Witter Reynolds, College Station, 
Texas. The family lives at 2705 Brothers 
Blvd., College Station, 77840. 

••• 
Kenneth E. Thomas (BS) is a financial 

planner and president of The Financial 
Planning Group, Inc. He and his wife, 
Anne" reside at 3401 Fraserdale Dr., 
Lexington, Ky. 40503. 

••• 
Dr. Robert W. Scott (BS) is a physician 

with the Springfield Clinic of Internal 
Medicine, Springfield, Mo. He and his wife, 
the former Janet Sue Bradford (BS), reside 
at 805 E. Stanford, Springfield, 65807. 

••• 
Roy W. Howard (BA) teaches at West­

bury Christian School, Houston, Texas. He 
and his wife, the former Irma Joan 
Gailbreath ('73), live at 6503 Wanda Lane, 
No. 367, Houston, 77074. 

••• 
Gary L. Roberson (BA) serves as minister 

for the Ray Road Church of Christ, 
Mauldin, S.C. He and his wife, the former 
Christy- Cantrell (BA'74), live at 312 Miller 
Road, Mauldin, 29662 . 

••• 
Ellen Joyce Kramar Banks (BS) is a 

family physician with Kaiser-Permanente, 
. San Diego, Calif. She resides with her 
' husband, James, -at 4260 58th St., San 

Diego, 92115. , 
••• 

J. Michael Allison (BS) is employed with 
Xerox Corporation as district sales planning 
manager. He and his wife, Sue, reside at 
1810 Live Oak Lane, Atlantic Beach, Fla. 
32233. 

••• 
Robert Lee White (BA) is vice president 

and CPA for G. R. Rush & Company, 
Chattanooga, Tenn. He is married to the 
former Charlotte Hewitt (BA'71) and they 
reside at 8310 . Northumberland Lane, 
Chattanooga, 37421. . 

••• Elizabeth Talbott studiesfora class as the semester draws to a close. (photo by Stan Green) 
Darlene Acklin Rollins teaches science at 

Gainesville High School, Gainesville, Fla. 
She and her husband, William (BA'71), 
reside at 2924 N.E. 18th Way, Gainesville, 
32601. 

••• 
Barbara Cross Crone (BA) is a substitute 

teacher in the public schools, Bentonville, 
Ark. She and her husband, Larry (BA'71), 
live at Route 1, Box 106, Bentonville, 72712. 

••• 
Paula Bitting Parker (BA) teaches at 

South Georgia Christian Academy. She and 
husband, James (BA'73), reside at 843 
Randolph Avenue, S.E., Dawson, GA. 
31742. 

•••• 
Janice Marie Sewell (BA) is employed 

with the Northern Trails Area Education 
Agency as itinerant, adapted physical 
education consultant. She resides at 1000 
South Illinois, Apt. 408, Mason City, Ia. 
50401. 

••• 
David Weldon Willis (BA) is a T-37 

instructor pilot with the U.S. Air Force. He 
and his wife, the former Dwina Whittle 
(BA), reside at 1314 Books, Vance AFB, 
Okla. 73701. 

••• 
Gerald Richard Burrow (BA) is a teacher 

in the public schools at Bossier City, La. He 
and his wife, Linda, live at 4216 Evelyn 
Street, Bossier City, 71112. 

••• 
Rhonda Jo Inness Potter (BA) is a sales 

clerk at Triangle, an art supply store that 
also does reproduction. She works part time 
while she attends Northeastern State 
University. She and her husband, Timothy, 
reside at 1214 East 33, Tulsa, Okla. 74105. 
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Donna Johnson McDowell is a 'pharmacy 
technician at Dunklin County Hospital. She 
and her husban,d, Larry, live at 1104 Elm 
Drive, Kennett, Mo. 63857. 

• •• 
Ricky Lynn Johnson (BA) is junior high 

counselor for Cabot Public Schools, Cabot, 
Ark. He and his wife, the former Virginia 
Bean (BA'73), live at 28 Robinson Street, 
Cabot, 72023. ... ' 

Michael L. Bradburn (BA) is a salesman, 
for Loomis International. His wife, the 
former Linda Claar (BS), is employed with 
Iberia General Hospital as dietitian. They 
reside,at 1501 South Patout, New Iberia, La. 
70560. 

••• 
Jeannette Rojas Dempsey is a kin­

dergarten' teacher for the public' schools, 
Texarkana, Ark. She and her husband, 
John (BA'71), reside at 2200 Senator, 
Texarkana, 75502. 

-... 
Dr. Harold Duncan Jr. (MA) serves as 

associate minister for Prestoncrest Church 
of Christ, Dallas, Texas. He and his wife, 
Rachel, reside at 6022 Prestoncrest Lane, 
Dallas, 75230. 

••• 
Cher Herron Sutherland (BA) is a 

registered nurse at Garfield Medical Center 
and also/is a graduate stud~nt at Fuller' 
Theological Seminary. She and her 
husband, Phil, reside at 233 North Orange, 
Apt. 126, Monterey Park, Calif. 91754. 

••• 
Dr. Anthony Wayne Kirk (BA) is 

assistant professor of physical education at 

Freed-Hardeman College. He and his wife, 
Deborah, live at 550 Galbraith, Henderson, 
Tenn. 38340. 

••• 
Sandra Williams Ware (BA) is a 

homemaker; her husband, Harry (BA'73), is 
a certified public accountant with Jon R. 
Brittenum & Associates, Little Rock, Ark. 
They live at 2824 Circlewood, Little Rock, 
,72207 . 

••• 
Lorna McKulDey Spruill (BS) is a 

homemaker; her husband, Phil, is senior 
vice president of Defender Industries, 
Columbia, S.C. The couple resides at 102 
Ligustrum Lane, Columbia,29209. ... -

Randy Verdell (BA} teaches and roaches 
at Sylvan Hills Junior High School, North 
Little Rock, Ark. He and his wife, the 
former Phyllis Goss ('75), reside with their 
two children, Joshua Ryan and Jordan 
Andrew, at 3800- Emerson, North Little 
Rock, 72116. 

••• 
Joan HenneSsee Graham (BS) teaches 

first grade in the public schools at Sparta, 
Tenn. She and her husband, David, live at 
Route 9, Bo~ 330, Sparta, 38583. 

CLASS OF 1973 
Paul A. Jacoby (BA) has been named 1984 

"Coach of the Year" by Region XIX of the 
National Junior College Athletic Association 
(NJCAA). Jacoby has served on the teaching 
and coach staff of Northeastern Christian 

Junior College in Villanova, Pa. since 1973. 
Jacoby is married to the fQrmer Valerie 
Ayers (BA'77) and they live at 819 Belvoir 
Road, Norristown, Pa. 19401. 

CLASS OF 1974 

Ken Kendall Ball (BA) is affiliate broker 
with Action Realty in Sevierville, Tenn. He 
and his wife, the former Judy Scammerhorn 
(BA'73), also own "Woodworks," a 
wholesale and retail supply company of 
wooden acce~ories for the home. They 
reside with their three children - Greg, 
Jennifer, and Jordan - at Route 7, Box 527, 
Oak Leaf Lane, Seymour, 37865. 

CLASS OF 1975 

Joe David (BA) and Joy Henley ('77) 
Roper have just returned from a Caribbean 
cruise aboard the SS Norway, the largest 
cruise ship in the world. While on board, 
they performed two nights with Shelly West. 
country music star and daughter of singer, 
Dottie West. Joe and Joy have been with 
Miss West's entourage for two years. Joe 
(J.R.) is Shelly's road manager and sings 
and plays guitar in the group; Joy plays 
piano and synthesizers and sings. The 
couple lives at 214 Old Hickory Blvd., 
Condo 194, Nashville, Tenn. 37221. 

••• 
Melinda Peyton Lamb (BA) is 

secretary/office manager with Waterways 
Experiment Station, Vicksburg, Miss. She is 
also secretary/treasurer of Vicksburg 
Amateur Radio Club. Her husband. Brent, 
is civil engineering technician with 
Waterways Experiment Station. The couple 
has a daughter, Melinda Michelle. The 
family's address is P.O. Box 183, Vicksburg, 
39180. 

CLASS OF 1976 

Ricky J. Barnes (BA) has been promoted 
to regional vice president with the A.L. 
Williams organization. He is married to the 
former Susan Alston (BSN'80) and they 
reside at l00i McDonald, Garland, Texas 
75041. 

CLASSOF19n 
Jeanne McGraw (BA) is a braille teacher 

at the Arkansas School for the Blind in 
Little Rock. Ark. She resides at 412 Not­
tingham, Little Rock, 72205. ••• • 

Charles C. Archer (BS) is accounting 
supervisor with the Arkansas Employment 
Security Division, Little Rock, Ark. He lives 
at 2123 Labette Manor Drive, Apt. E-13, 
Little Rock, 72205. 

••• 
Sam Stewart (BA) is employed as 

counselor with the Salem Public Schools. He 
and his wife, Debbie, live in Salem, Ark., 
and their address is P.O. Box 856, Sale~. 
72576. 

••• 
Stephen L. Morris is self employed as a 

cabinet maker - Morris Woodworking. He 
is married to the former Karen Whit­
tenberger (BSN'79) who is a nurse at 
Riverview Hospital. The couple lives at 9021 
Tedburn Circle, Little Rock, Ark. 72209. 

••• 
Christine Clausen Kitchens (BSMT) is a 

homemaker while her husband serves as a 
Navy lieutenant on the administrative staff 

l(continued on page 14) 
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Harding University Branches Out 

Communication Area Enjoys Rapid Growth 
When Harding embraced university 

status in the fall of 1979 the change in title 
marked the beginning of a new growth era 
for the school. A logical result of the new 
growth has been the metamorphosis of the 
spee~h and journalism departments into the 
single Department of Communication. 

After the mid-year exit of Dr. Heber 
Taylor, the journalism chairman, into the 
private business sector in January 1984, it 
seemed appropriate to follow a logical trend 
and merge journalism with the speech 
department, which already handled in­
struction in the other mass media - radio 
and television. The creation of the 
Department of Communication finally 
brought the teaching of all modern, mass 
media under one roof. 

"I think it's working well," said Dr. Evan 
Ulrey, chairman of the department. "The 
change has given a kind of unity to the 
whole a~ea (of communication)." 

Partial results of the change include a 
more streamlined approach, the upgrading 
of some opportunities and requirements for 
print journalism majors, and increased 
hands-on opportunities for radio/television 
majors. 

While still separated in the 1983-84 
school year, the departments of speech and 
journalism offered majors in a total of eight 
areas. The departments overlapped con­
siderably, however:with the similar majors 
of mass media being offered by journalism 
and mass communication being offered _ by 
speech. 

Mass communication majors were 
required to take introductory journalism 
courses and majors in mass media, public 
relations or advertising had required 
courses in the speech department. 

With the creation of the Department of 
Communication duplication has been 
largely eliminated. For instance, the courses 
"Introduction to Journalism," and "In-

-troduction to Mass 'Communication" have 
been combined. Majors from the former two 
departments have either been combined, 
redefined or renamed, giving students a 
more precise knowledge ofthe major area of 
study. 

Students may now choose majors from 
two general areas - communication and 
mass communication. 

From the area of communication students 
may major in oral communication, which 
replaces the old speech major; theater or 
theater management, both which replace 
the old drama major; or communication 
disorders, which replaces the old speech 
therapy major. 

In the area of mass communications the 
advertising major and the public relations 
major have been carried' over basically 
intact from the journalism department. A 
major in print journalism replaces the old 
journalism major and a major in 
radio/television replaces the two ' majors of 
mass communication and mass media. 

For students from the old journalism 
department with majors in print journalism, 
advertising or public relations, the change 
to the Department of Communication has 
brought about a more challenging program 
which may offer better opportunities for 
employment after graduation. Beginning in 
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the fall of 1985 those students will join the 
radio/television majors in being required to 
fulfill an internship. 

Under the speech department, for several 
years mass communication majors had been 
required to fulfill internships. The result has 
been an abundance of those students fin­
ding ready employment; as many as four 

have worked at one time for the same Little 
Rock television station. 

"The internship is one ofthe best features 
ofthe whole program," stated Dr. Ulrey. "It 
was not required of journalism students 
before. They had the choice between an 
internship or an independent study." 
(continued ' next page) 
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By Brad Watson 

Another plus for the Department of 
Communication, Dr. Ulrey points out, has 
been the establishment of TV-12, Har­
ding's student-operated, cable-access 
channel. The station has given 
radio/television majors additional hands-on 
experience before internships begin. This 
has made the internships more valuable 
learning experiences in that students can 
learn more advanced aspects of their future 
jobs during the time that was normally used 
in just learning basics. 

"I think Channel 12 has done a 

Just a few of the junctions of Harding's 
multi-faceted communication program are 
represented in the photographs on these 
pages. Clockwise from the top, they show: 
Communication disorder students Karen 
McLarty and Kay White teach Chris 
Castleberry how to better pronounce the 
letter L by placing peanut butter on the roof 
of Chris's mouth where his tongue should 
touch when he says the letter; Channel 12 
cameraman Greg Smith scans the audience 

tremendous amount of good for us," Ulrey 
said. 

Ulrey indicated the overall good that has 
come from the creation of the Department 
of Communication is that the students get a 
better picture of the role of personal and 
mass communication in the world today. 

"All these aspects of communication are 
interrelated," explained Ulrey. "In this new 
arrangement a student begins to grasp his 
role in relation to other communication 
areas ... To me, our students are just better 
prepared." 

as, in the background, Dr. David Burks 
listens to a question from the audience for 
American Studies speaker, Helmut Sch­
midt, former chancellor of West Germany; 
Lori Bailey sings out as "Irene M.olloy" 
during the 1984 Homecoming musical 
production "Hello Dolly"; Communication 
instructor Mike James looks up from the 
control panel in the Channel 12 studio; 
James Kiggins cues up a record for campus 
radio station KHCA. 
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(continued from page 11) 
of Naval Hospital, Cherry Point, N.C. They 
reside with their two children, Nathanael 
and Jonathon, at 6 Roosevelt Blvd., 
Havelock, 28532. 

• •• 
Connie Land Cauthen (SA) is a telephone 

operator with AT&T Communications 
Systems. She and her husband, George, 
reside at 3927 N.W. 21st Terrace, 
Gainesville, Fla. 32605 . 

••• 
Allen P. Jeter (BA) is teacher and coach at 

Crossett Public Schools. He and his wife, the 
former Carla Allison ('76), reside at 1607 S. 
Louisiana, Crossett, Ark. 71635 . 

••• 
David A. Boivie (BA) is employed with 

Stephen F. Austin State University. His 
wife, the former Pam Hinman (BA), is desk 
supervisor at the University Center. Stephen 
F. Austin State University. Their address is 
Box 6067 SFASU, Nacogdoches, Texas 
75962. 

• •• 
Sarah Jane Fosh~ Johnston (BS) is a 

registered nurse at Women's Hospital of 
Texas. She and her husband, Richard 
William, live at 614 Beechberd, Missouri 
City, Texas 77489 . 

••• 
Janielle Christine Jones (BA) is water 

plant operator for the City of Zanesville 
Water Department, Zanesville, Ohio. She 
lives at 1318 Moxahala Ave., Zanesville, 
43701. 

••• 
Kathleen Robinson Schubmehl (SA) 

teaches frrst and second grades at 
Tredyffrin/Easttown Schools. She and her 
husband, Robert, live at 17 c;reentree Lane, 
Malvern, Pa. 19355. 

••• 
Cathy Stanley Beckman (BA) is a 

homemaker; her husband, James David, is a 
chemical processor with the DuPont 
Company. They reside at 16719 Barcelona, 
Friendswood, Texas 77546. 

••• 
Keith B. Cozort serves as minister for -the 

Church of Christ, Limon, Colo. He and his 
wife, Cheryl,live in Limon and their address 
is P.O. Box 736, Limon, 80828. ..... 

Minter Michael Molello is assistant 
supervisor with The Jonathan Corporation, 
Virginia Beach, Va. He resides at 610 23rd 
Street, Virginia Beach, 23451. 

••• 
Darce Paschall (CCP) is minister for the 

Church of Christ, Streator, III. He and his 
wife, Betty, reside at 611 Columbus, Route 
2, Streator, 61364. ....... 

Mark T. Mclean (BA) serves as pulpit 
minister for the Church of Christ in North 
Bend, Ore. He is married to the former 
Nancy Reynolds (BA'78), and they reside at 
1921 Johnson, North Bend, 97459. ....... 

Steven Donald Williams is employed as 
superintendent with Irvine Electric 
Company, Chandler, Ariz. He and his wife, 
the former Susan Raburn (BA'79), reside at 
2224 W. Monroe Street, Chandler, 85224. 

I ..... 

Diana Kay Kelley (BA) is employed with 
H. C. Prangle as assistant merchandiser. 
She lives at 1425 Seminary, Apt. B, Rock­
ford, Ill. 61108. 

••• 
Sue Ellen Vermeer Tucker (BA) is an 

elementary teacher in the public schools in 
Phoenix. Ariz. She and her husband, 
Steven, reside at 7763 North 19th Ave., 
Phoenix, 85021. 

••• 
James G. Cruce (BA) is a human 

development specialist with the North Side 
Child Development Center, Columbus, 
Ohio. His address is P.O. Box 29627, 
Columbus, 43229. 

••• 
Durward Lynn Davis is a machinist with 

Davis & Klepzig Tool Shop. He and his 
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Associate Professor of Nursing Helen Lambert gives special instruction to student Carolyn Barter, a senior from McCrory, Ark . 

wife, the former Sharon Gay Puckett 
(BA'76), live at Route 1, Box SSC, Abbeville, 
Miss. 38601. 

••• 
Robert N. Baggett (BS) is vice president 

for finance at Duphil, Inc. Ht and his wife, 
Melina, live in Sulphur, La. The,ir address is 
P.O. Box 408, Sulphur, 70664. 

••• 
Diane Marie Earnhart Inman (BA) is a 

child c~te wo/:ker at Boles Home, QniD,Ian, 
~Tex.as. She and her husband, Greg (BA'SO), 
live at RQute 3, Box 40, Quinlan, 75474. 

••• 
ViVian Loftin Wywias is a legal secretary 

with Leek, Purnell, Boren, Laney & Neely. 
She and her husband, Lee, live at 3608 
Chamberland, Arlington, Texas 76014. 

••• 
Rebecca L. Betts (BS) is a registered nurse 

in pediatrics at Santa Rosa HOspital, San 
Antoriio, Texas. She resides at 10818 Green 
Hurst, San Antonio, 78223. 

••• 
Fred "Buster" Clem is in automotive 

replacement sales as district sales. manager 
for T.R.W., Inc., Cleveland, Ohio. He 
resides with · his wife, Candy, and three 
children - Joshua, April, and Samuel- at 
Route 1, Box 191C, CaqIpbell, Texas 75422. 

• •• 
Danny L. Duclos (BA) teaches biology in 

the public schoois and is head coach for 
men and women swimming. He and his 
wife, Lorie, live at 50 Hill Street, Dubuque, 
Iowa 52001. 

• •• 
Rickey Ja)l Shirley (BA) serves as youth 

minister for the Bristol Road Church of 
Christ, Flint, Mich. He is married to the 
former Kimberly Curtis (BA) and they live 
at 3292 Van Camper, Flint, 48507. 

• •• 
Nancy Baither Symanowitz (BS) is a 

registered nurse in the neonatal intensive 
care unit of Danbury Hospital, Danbury, 
Conn. She and husband, Paul (BSW'80), 
reside at 12 Horseshoe Drive, Brookfield, 
06804. 

••• 
Timothy W. Cathey is vice president of 

the Texas Commerce Bank. He and his wife, 
the former Vicki Stephens ('78), live at 338 
Pepperwood, Coppell, Texas 750.19. 

* •• 
David L. Hamilton (BA) is an air in­

telligence officer in the U.S. Air Force. He is 

married to the former Jacquelyn Purdom 
(BS) and they reside at 388-A Ricketts 
Road, Monterey, Calif. 93940. 

• •• 
Reba Lewis Sloan (SS) is employed as 

dietitian for Baptist Hospital and Nautilus 
Fitness Cent~r, Nashville. Tenn. She and 
her husband, Gilbert Kevin (SA), live at 
1817 Shackleford, Nashville; 37215 . 

••• 
;~;J~.ebe.C,~a Jean Am0!e (MAR) is employed 
'llh the' ··UniversitY'!', Christian :- Strident 
Center, University of Mississippi, Oxford. 
She lives at 1802 East Jackson Ave., Oxford, 
38655. ••• 

Louanne Watson (BS) is a certified nurse­
midwife at Laclucs Women's Hospital.. She 
resides at 263 Ohio, No. I, Pasadena, Calif. 
91106. ••• 

Lois Ann Carrel KinneY (BS) is a 
registered nurse in the intensive care unit of 
Riverside Hospital. She and her husband, 
Wayne (BS'79), live at 1653 B 7th Avenue, 
Langley 'AFB, Va. 23.665 . 

••• 
Jefferson F. Smith (SA) is a salesman with 

Thurman Carpet Dist., Memphis, Tenn. He 
and his wife, the former Madonna Wallace 
(BS) resides at 6801 Seven Valley, Memphis, 
38115 . • •• 

Carolyn Watts Blount (BA) is a 
homemaker; her husband, Paul, is 
marketing director for "Roofing Plus." 
They reside at 8877 West Floyd Ave., 
Lakewood, Colo; 80227. 

• •• • 
Lavonne Terry Campbell is credit clerk 

with Montgomery Ward. She and her 
husband, Tom, live at 502 North Oak, 
Webb City, Mo. 64870. 

••• 
Judy Pepper LaCaze is self employed as a 

beauty consultant with Mary Kay 
Cosmetics. She and her husband, Randy 
('785; re$ide at 111 Victoria Hills, Owens 
Cross Roads, Ala. 35763. 

••• 
Cindi Pitts (BA) is a franchised instructor 

with Jazzercise, Inc., . Memphis, Tenn. She 
lives at 2573 Four Seasons Dr., Memphis. 
38134. 

••• 
Cynthia Kyle Merritt teaches fourth 

grade in the public schools in Magnolia, 
Ark. She and her husband, Dennis, reside at 

Route 2, 33 Timberlane, ¥agnolia, 71753. 
••• 

Sheila Ganelle Stephenson (BA) is a 
teacher at Mineral Springs Elementary 
School. She lives at Route 1, Box 357, 
Dierks, Ark. 71833. 

••• 
Charles D. Handy (BS) is self employed as 

an oil and gas operator/driller, Magnolia, 
Ark. He lives at 1200 Summit, Magnolia, 
71753. 

••• 
Dale Ernest Graham (SA) serves as 

minister for the Church of Christ, Cave 
Springs, Ark. He and his wife, JoAnn, live in 
Cave Springs and their address ~ Box 1, 
Cave Springs, 72718. 

• •• 
David Glen Wilson is a farmer for L. R. 

Wilson Farms, Inc. He and his wife, 
Beverly, live at Hickory Ridge, Ark. Their 
address is P.O. Box 21, Hickory Ridge, 
72347. 

• •• 
Robert G. Allen Jr. is registrar at 

Alabama Christian School of Religion, 
Montgomery, Ala. He and his wife, 
Virginia, reside at 847 North Gap Loop, 
Montgomery, 36110. 

• •• 
James Wayne Bristow (BA) is employed 

with Montavilla Sheet Metal Company, 
Vancouver, Wash. He and his wife, Carrie, 
reside at 3107 Van Allman, Vancouver, 
98660. 

••• 
Virgil Randolph Lainbeth (BA) is 

elementary principal at Harding Acad~my 
in Searcy, Ark. His address is Box 812, 
Station A, Searcy, 72143. 

••• 
Floyd W. Clark Jr. (BS) is an insurance 

agent with Farm Bureau Insurance 
Company. He is married to the former 
Coleen Roberson (BA) who is an elementary 
schoql teacher. They reside at Route 4, Box 
192, Nashville, Ark. 71852. 

• •• 
Gregory Charles Hall (BA) is employed 

with Southwestern Bell Telephone Company 
as assistant staff manager of information 
systems. His address is P.O. Box 69111, St. 
Louis, Mo. 63169. 

• •• 
Ward T. Wilson (BS) is a self employed 

certified public accountant. He is married to 
the former Karen Pirtle ('79) and they reside 
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at 3000 Sallisaw Drive, North Little Rock, 
Ark. 72116. 

•• * 
Jerome B. NaIl (BA) serves as campus and 

youth minister for the Riverside Church of 
Christ, Lafayette, La. He and his wife, the 
former Kim Petrey ('82), live at 717 
Genevieve Drive, Lafayette, 70503. 

iloilo. 

Terry L. Widner is employed with Garden 
Gallery, Inc. as landscape designer. He and 
his wife, Debbie, live at 1873 Trevilian Way, 
Louisville, Ky. 40205. 

iloilo. 

Robert M. Winston (BA) is manager of a 
carpet store, Fashion Floors. He and his 
wife,. the former Kimberly Webb (BA'78), 
reside at 2209 Glen Forest Lane, Plano, 
Texas 75023. 

iloilo. 

Mona Smelser (BA) is employed with 
Phifer Wire Products, Inc. as manager of 
sales promotions. She resides at Route 3, 
Box 417, Tuscaloosa, Ala. 35401. 

iloilo. 

Benny C. Barber is employed with the 
First Citizens National Bank in pur­
chasing/operations, Tupelo, Miss. He lives 
at 1321 Ida Street, Apt. P-19, Tupelo, 
38S01. 

••• 
Deborah- Ann Dauck Duncan (BS) is a 

homemaker; her husband, Leon, works for 
the University of Arkansas Cooperative 
Extension Service. He is the agricultural 
county agent for Sharp County at Ash Flat, 
Ark. They .live at 28 Nameoki Drive, 
Cherokee Village, 72525. 

iloilo. 

Kareyn Phillips Hall (BA) is employed 
with Southwestern Bell Telephone Com­
pany. She is in charge of a group that 
provides computer and data support for the 
Missouri State forecasting organization. She 
lives at 876 Diversey Drive, St. Louis, Mo. 
63126. 

iloilo. 

Marguerite Shay McKinney (BSMT) is a 
medical technologist at Pekin Memorial 
Hospital. She and her husband, Booth 
(BS'75), reside at 206 Clark Street, Morton, 
Ill. 61550. 

••• 
John D. Madison (CCP) serves as minister 

for the Church of Christ, Collingswood, N.J. 
He and his wife, Kaye, live at l11-A Sutton 
Towers, Collingswood, 08107. 

iloilo • . 

Everett Cox is service manager for Dumas 
Motor Company, Dumas, Ark. He and his 
wife, Donna, live in Dumas and their ad­
dress is Box 395, Dumas, 71639. 

iloilo. 

Lot Therrio (BA) serves as minister for the 
Church of Christ, Newark, He lives at 91 
Salem Church Road, Newark, 19713. 

iloilo. 

Jan Stewart Paessler is employed with 
I nsurex Corporation as a registered nurse. 
She and her husband, David Carl, reside at 
Route 4, Box I09A, Kevil, Ky. 42053. 

••• 
Cliff A. Jones (M.Ed.) is a teacher and 

director of drama at Greater Atlanta 
Christian School. He and his wife, Diane, 
reside ,at 3904 Millwood Lane, Lilburn, Ga. 
30247. 

iloilo. 

Mark Stanley Eubanks is employed with 
the National Archives & Records Ad­
ministration as space and facilities 
specialist. He lives at 5623 Magnolia Lane, 
Alexandria, Va .. 22311. 

••• 
John J. Eastland (BS) is employed with 

the Texas Twelfth Court of Appeals as an 
attorney. He and his wife, the former 
Patricia Lynn Starks ('79), reside at 2626 
Chilton, Tyler, Texas 75701. 

iloilo. 

Pamela Thomason Shelby is office 
manager for the White Station Church of 
Christ, Memphis, Tenn. She lives at 4937 
Kimball, Memphis, 38117. 

HARDING UNIVERSITY 

Karol Kennedy Edwards teaches in the 
public school system in Longview, Texas. 
She and her husband, Philip, live. at Route 
9, Box 529AA, Longview, 75601. 

iloilo. 

Susie Hobbs Geraci is statistical control 
coordinator with Helena Laboratories, 
Beaumont, Texas. She and her husband , 
Daniel, reside at 2341 Ashley, Beaumont, 
77702. ' 

iloilo. 

Charlene Dabbs Dean (BSN) is a 
registered nurse at the Community Blood 
Center of Greater Kansas City. She and 
husband, Ricky, live at 9420 Cleveland, Apt. 
SO, Kansas City, Mo. 64132. 

" iloilo. 

Myra Evans Hale (BBA) is manager of the 
credit/collateral department, First National 
Bank of Ruston. She and her husband, 
Kenneth, live at 500 South Farmerville 
Street, Ruston, La. 71270. • 

iloilo. 

Debra Pruett Stokes (BA) is elementary • 
music specialist with Crowley's Ridge 
Academy, Paragould, Ark. She and her 
husband, Dan (BA'76), live at 5206 Wendy, 
Paragould, 72450. 

iloilo. 

Mary Lou Taylor Dunn (M.Ed.), is 
executive director of the Sunshine School, 
Searcy, Ark. She lives at 1500 West Arch, 
Searcy, 72143. 

••• 
Randall E. Reeves (BS) is employed in the 

sales department of Amp Special Industries. 
He and his wife, the former Christi Diane 
Turner (BA'79), reside at 10 Whippoorwill, 
Searcy, 72143. 

••• 
Robert M. Bledsoe (BS) is bookkeeper at 

Farmers Elevator & Warehouse, Newport, 
Ark. He is married to the former Julie Davis 
(BA'76) and they reside at 701 Holden 
Avenue, Newport, 72112. 

Diana Kay Stockberger Hess (BS) is 
community health nurse with the Missouri 
Crippled Children Service. She resides with 
her husband, Robert, and two sons, David 
and Daniel, at Route 2, Box 85, Exeter, Mo. 
65647. 

iloilo. 

Judith Redden Kenley (BS) is director of 
social work services for Mid-South Christian 
Nursing Home. She and her husband, Gary, 
live at 717 Cornell, West Memphis, Ark. 
72-301. 

iloilo. 

Randy Tribble (BA) teaches and coaches 
at Harding University, Searcy, Ark. He is 
married to the former Tina Reese (BA), and 
they reside at 134 Western . Hills, Searcy, 
72143. 

CLASS OF 1978 

Lyn Leonard Blansett (BS) is a 
homemaker. Her husband, Wiley, is with 
Blansett lnsurance Company, Searcy, Ark. 
The couple lives with. their two sons, 
Ma~ew and Timothy, at 136 Western Hills 
Drive, Searcy, 72143 . 

••• 
Dorothy Layden Yatbrough (BA) teaches 

in the Kensett (Ark.) Public School. She and 
her husband, E.W., reside at Route 1, Box 
57, Searcy, 72143. 

••• 
Robert Lane Harding (BS) is a sales 

representative with Borcley/Graphic 
Division/Ink. He and his wife, Lezlie, live at 
5110 Lakeridge Court, Garland, Texas 
75043. 

iloilo. 

Alan Earl Beach (BS) is executive director 
of the Greater Chattanooga' Christian 

Sunshine and warm temperatures bring the students outside to study and visit. 
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Services, a child care and counseling 
agency. He is married to the former Joni 
Voss (BA'77) and they live at 63 Brownwood 
Circle, Ringgold, Ga. 30736. 

• •• 
Mark E. Bell (BA) is a chaplain in the 

U.S. Air Force. He and his wife, the former 
Kathryn Pritchett (BA) reside at 9008 B 
Arantz, Laughlin AFB, Texas 78840. 

••• 
Scott Allen Stafford (BA) is plant 

manager of Suisman &.Blumenthal, Inc. He 
is married to the former Beth Anne 
Maguffee (BS'76) and they live at 122 New 
State Road, Apt. C, Manchester, Conn. 
06040. 

iloilo. 

. Bobby G. Weaver works with the Florida 
State Fair events manager. His wife, the 
former Tina. Louise Sparks, is a nurse at 
Brandon Community Hospital. They reside 
at 3709 Steams Road, Valrico, Fla. 33594. 

iloilo. 

Penny Sue Palmore Beatty is senior 
res.earch chemist with Dow Chemical 
Company. She and husband, Daryl, live at 
301 Lotus, Lake Jackson, Texas 77566. 

iloilo. 

Monte Tatom (BA) teaches basic skills at 
Eight Mile Elementary School in Mobile, 
Ala. His wife, the former Beth Brittain 
(BSN'SO) is a registered" nurse at Southland 
Hospital. They live at 1921 Shelton Beach 
Road, Mobile, 36618. 

iloilo. 

Darla Jean Seaton Hairston is a 
homemaker. Her husband, Kent, is a 
maintenance electrician with Chef Pierre, 
Inc. They live with their son, Ryan Kent, at 
1205 Rennie Lake Road, Traverse City, 
Mich. 49684. 

iloilo. 

Carolyn Drennan Dacus (BS) is employed 
with Baxter County Regional Hospital as 
accounts payable clerk. Her husband, Dan 
Gary (BS'80), does drafting at Isbell 
Engineering and Surveying Company. They 
live at Route 1, Box 15A, Clarkridge, Ark. 
72623. 

••• 
Diana Statton Brown works as a 

telephone operator for "Carolyn'S Com­
munications," which is an answering 
service. She and husband, Steve (BA'77), 
live at 3118D Sloping Terrace, Snellville, 
Ga. 30278. 

iloilo. 

·Christy Mitchell Rampton (BSN) is a 
registered nurse consultant with the Mid 
City Management Company. She and 
husband , Bill (BS'76), reside at 7019 Bent 
Creek Road, Germantown, Tenn. 38138. 

iloilo. 

Aubrey Dwaine Powell (BA) serves as 
minister for the Church of Christ in East 
Point, Ga. He and his wife, the former 
Nancy Ganus (BA), live at 2515 Hogan 
Road, East Point, 30344. 

iloilo. 

Kay Rowe Phillips (B'5) is a social worker 
with Florence Crittenton Home, Little Rock, 
Ark. She and her husband, Dwight (BA'SO), 
reside at 7109 Archwood Drive, Little Rock, 
72204. 

iloilo. 

Gary Jones (BA) works part time as 
camplls minister for the Alameda Church of 
Christ while attending Oklahoma University 
working toward a Ph.D. in counseling 
psychology. He and his wife, the former 
Vicki Caldwell ('79), reside at 1913 Crystal 
Circle, Norman, Okla. 73069. 

iloilo. 

Emily Ruth Whisenant Chism (BSN) is a 
registered nurse at Bellville General 
Hospital, Bellville, Texas. Her husband, 
Stanley (BA), serves as minister for the 
Church of Christ. They reside at 817 Wendt 
St., Bellville, 77418. 

•• * 
Steve Courson (BS) is librarian and art 

teacher at Great Lakes Christian College, 
Beamsville, Ontario, Canada. Steve is 
married to the former Rebecca Ellis (BA) 

(continued on page 16) 
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(continued from page 15) 
and they have two children, Katrina and 
Christopher. The family's address is Box 
399, BeamsvilIe, LOR 1BO. 

••• 
Richard Alan Fancher (BA) serves as 

minister of education with the Sharpstown 
Church of Christ, Houston, Texas; He and 
wife, Cindy, reside at 13907 Plantation 
Valley Drive, Houston, 77083. 

••• 
Bradford A. Scott (BA) is an accountant 

with Kaiser-Francis Oil Company. He and 
his wife, Linda, reside at 3611 Redbud 

.Drive, Sand Springs, Okla. 74063. 
••• 

Jim Bob Humphrey (BS) is funeral 
director and manager of Humphrey Funeral 
Service, Russellville, Ark. He is married to 
the former Betty Thomas (BA) and they 
reside at 32 Shalimar, Russellville, 72801. 

••• 
Wendell Fred Glass Jr. (BA) is technical 

consultant with AT&T, Bossier City, La. He 
and his wife, the former Rhonda Jo Smythe 
('79), live at 630~ Anandale, Bossier City, 
71112. ••• 

Joe H. Miller (BA) is automotive 
machinist with W-R Motor Supply in 
Searcy, Ark. He and his wife, the former 
Nancy Favalion (BA'77), reside at 910 East 
River, Searcy, 72143. 

••• 
Alan Dean Campbell (BS) is creative 

skills instructor with United Cerebral Palsy. 
He lives at 6401 Alkire Road, Galloway, 
Ohio 43119. ••• 

Carole L. Howell (M.Ed.) is a high school 
English te~cher at Chickasaw Academy, 
Aberdeen, Miss. . She resides at 115 
Highland Ave., Aberdeen, 39730. 

••• 
Sharon Kay Martin Battles (BA) is an 

elementary teacher at Westbury Christian 
School, Houston, Texas. She and her 
husband, Steven, live at 9700 Glenfield 
Court, No. 825, Houston, 77096. 

••• 
Martia Laney Norrell is a homemaker 

and bookkeeper for her husband, Tom's; 
business - The Lawnclipper. They reside at 
700 Camp Street, EI Dorado, Ark. 71730. 

••• 
Barbara Beene Duke is a registered 

dental hygenist working for het husband, 
Tim ('73), who is a dentist. The family lives 
at Route 2, Box 75, Valley Road, Searcy, 
Ark. 72143. **. 

Russell W. Passafiume (BA) is com­
mercial accounts manager with Reliance 
Insurance Company. He is married to the 
former Rhonda Gay Nichols ('81) who 
teaches at Homewood Church of Christ Day 
School. They reside at 1528 Wellington 
RQad, Birmingham, Ala. 35209. 

••• 
William H. Visalli (BA) serves as minister 

for the Church of Christ in EI Dorado 
Springs, Mo. His wife, the former Roni Fish 
(BA), is a homemaker. They live at 302 E. 
Hospital Road, EI Dorado Springs, 64744. 

• ** 
Kenneth Hamilton (BS) is senior ac­

countant with Murphy Oil Company in EI 
Dorado, Ark. He resides at 536 Meadow 
Lane, EI Dorado, 71730. 

**. 
Russell W. Porter (BA) is junior high 

school math teacher at Tyler Street 
Christian Academy. His wife, the former 
Barbara Hoover (BSN'79) is obstetrical staff 
nurse at St. Paul Hospital. They live at 2510 
New Orleans, No. 122, Dallas, Texas 75235. 

*** 
Jerry Gailbreath (BS) is director of allied 

health with Marygrove College. He is 
married to the former Teresa Miller (BSN) 
who is a registered nurse at William 
Beaumont Hospital. The couple resides 'at 
27662 Parkview, No. 901, Warren, Mich. 
48092. 

*** 
R. C. Polk (BA) is teacher, preacher, and 
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mechanic at Namwianga Christian 
Secondary School. He and his wife's (Libby) 
address is Box 620022, Kalomo, Zambia, 
Africa. 

••• 
Pamela DenIse Turney Harris (BS) is 

employed with Valley Food Service as 
clinical dietitian at Mercy Hospital, 
Vicksburg, Miss. Her husband, Bob (BS) is 
·a chemist. They live at 102 Amberwood, 
Clinton, 39056. 

••• 
Lucy Brooks Marr (BSMT) IS education 

coordinator with Leon County Blood Bank, 
Tallahassee, Fla. She' and her husband, 
Greg (BS), live at 2007 Chuli Nene, 
Tallahassee, 32301. 

••• 
Sandra Holloway Shepard is an internal 

medicine physician. She and her husband, 
Brian, reside at 2205 Marshall Drive, 
Edmond, Okla. 73034. 

••• 
David Glenn Stobaugh (BS) is wildlife 

biologist with the Arkansas Game and Fish 
Commission. He is married to the former 
Ann Addison (BSN) who is a registered 
nurse working at The Family Clinic for Dr. 
Kevin R. Carlson. They , live at 167 East 
Dawn, DeQueen, Ark. 71832. 

••• 
Terry 1. Noblin (BS)' is personnel manager 

at H. J. Wilson's Catalog Showroom. He 
resides at 6801 West 19th, No. 46, Lubbock, 
Texas 79407. 

••• 
Dana Elizabeth Mooneyham Gibson (BA) 

is employed with Nettleton High School 
whete she teaches physical education and is 
gymnastics and cheerleader coach. She and 
her husband, James Kent Gibson, live at 
Brookland, Ark. Their address is Box 104, 
Brookland, 72417. 

••• 
Craig W. Beard (BA) is reference 

librarian with Harding Uiliv~ity, Searcy, 
Ark. He and his wife, Kathleen, reside at 13 
CottonwoOd Drive, Scaray, 72143. • *. ' 

Jeraine Root (BA) is sales consultant with 
Photo Company of America. She lives at 

1355 Wakefieid, Houston, Texas 77018. 
, ... 

Adell McFann Morris (BS}teaches home 
economics and junior high science in the 
Griffithvilfe, Ark. Public SC.hools. She and 
husband, Brad, reside at 1200 North Hayes, 
Searcy, 72143.. ' 

••• 
.Darla Jane Stanage (BA) teaChes fourth 

grade at Central .Arkansas Christian 
Schools. She lives at 470S-:K Augusta Circle, 
North Little Rock, Ark. 72118 . 

••• 
Rod Dollins (BA) recently graduated from 

Southeast Missouri State University with a 
Master's de,gree in the area of elementary 
administratiQn. He teaches fifth grade at 
Eugene Field Elementary School in Poplar 
Bluff, Mo. He is married to the former 
S,usan Rector (BS'79), supervisor of ac- . 
counting at Ozark Border Electric 
Cooperative in Poplar Bluff. The couple 
resides at 1713 Rober Street, Poplar Bluff, 
63901. 

••• 
Marilyn Janice Holmes Painter (BA) is 

employed with Oualline & Associates, Inc. 
Architecture/Interiors as business manager. 
She and husband, Paul, live at 503 Mor­
ningside Drive, Euless, Texas 76039. 

••• 
Timothy Steven Rinehart (BA) is a 

paramedic with Metro Ambulance Service, 
Little Rock, Ark. He resides at 5201 Geyer 
Springs Road, No. 67, Little Rock, 72209-
1547; 

••• 
Kregg R. Hood (BA) is associate minister 

for the Broadway Church of Christ, Lub­
bock, Texas. He lives at 3403 36th, Lub­
bock, 79413. 

••• 
Gregory J. Jeffcott is vice president of 

Jeffcott, Inc., a real estate development 
firm. His address is P.O. Box 1206, Ft. 
Myers, Fla. 33902. 

, ... 
Larry Michael McGinnis is staff phar­

macist with Central Arkansas General 
Hospital Pharmacy. He resides with his 
wife, the former Sarah Birdwell ('84), and 

Senior Donna Cash of Carmel, Ind., was named May Fete queen during ceremonies in April. 
Attendants were Pam Holladay of Birmingham, Ala. and Mary Ann Fowler of Southaven, 
Miss. The coronation followed the traditional wrapping of the Maypole. 

daughter, Micah Alanna, at 33 Indian Trail, 
Searcy, Ark. 72143. 

••• 
Debra Martin Duncan is employed as 

secretary to Dr. A. B. Pyland, D.D.S. She 
and husband, Terry, live at 41 Whip­
poorwill, Searcy, 72143. ' 

• •• 
Daria Denham Gerding (BS) is financial 

assistant with Boston Gear. She lives with 
her husband, Larry, at 3394 Ellen Ave., 
Hebron, Ky. 41048. 

• •• 
Helen Louise Roberson Lober is em­

ployed with Flynn & Associates as legal 
secretary. She lives with her husband, 
Charles, at 109 Moss Trail, Goodlettsville, 
.Tenn. 37072. 

••• 
Mark Howell (CCP) serves as minister for 

the Center Hill Church of Christ, 
Paragould, Ark. He resides with his wife, 
Karen, at Route 7, Box 3S8-A, Paragould, 
72450. 

• •• 
Norm, Morgan (CCP) serves as minister 

for the Bardon Springs Church of Christ, 
Piedmont, Ala. He and his wife, Patricia, 
live at Route 2, Box 407, Piedmont, 36272. 

• •• 
Michael D. Suiter (CCP) is minister for 

the Church of Christ in Clayton, N.M. He 
and his wife, Margie, reside at 821 Oak St., 
Clayton, 88415. 

• •• 
Alesa Thompson Garner is senior med 

tech hematologist at St. Vincent's In­
firmary, Little Rock, Arkl Her husband, 
Dave (BA'71), is compliance officer for 
Guarantee Student Loans . of Arkansas. 
They reside with their son, Jeffrey David, at 
7820 Woodhaven, Little Rock, 722~. 

• •• 
Terry Hallford Birdwell (BS) serves as 

deputy clerk with the U.S. District Clerk for 
Federal Court, Houston, Texas. She and her 
husband, Cody, live at 10837 Sandpiper, 
Houston, 77096 . 

••• 
Tina Louise Sparks Weaver is a registered 

nurse at Humana Hospital, Brandon, Fla. 
She resides with her husband, Bobby" at 
3709 Stearns Road, Valrico, 33594 . 

••• 
Robert Scott Trout (BA) is a captain in 

the U.S. Marine Corps. He is director of the 
Special Training Division, Marine Corps 
Recruit Depot, Parris Island, S.C. He is 
married to the former Ingrid Melson (BA) 
and they reside with their three children -
Soren, Max, and Kiersti - at 1803 !;enora 
Drive, Port Royal, S.c. 29935. 

••• 
Paul R. Colvin (BA) is speech pathologist 

with the public schools in Shreveport, La. 
He is married to the former Teresa Proffitt 
(BA) and they live at 3309 Linda Street, 
Shreveport, 71119. 

••• 
Thomas Allen Buterbaugh (BA) is art 

director at Josten's. He lives at 2191 
Memorial Drive, G-83, Clarksville, Tenn. 
37040. 

• •• 
Beva Jean Whitford Cline is an instructor 

at Heights Psychiatric Hospital, 
Albuquerque, N.M. She and her husband, 
Kevin (BS'79), reside at 7912 Potomac 
Court, N.E., Albuquerque, 87109. 

••• 
Steven L. Butterfield (BA) is a sales 

representative with McNeil 
Pharamaceutical firm. He resides with his 
wife, Linda, at 3410 Bristol, Arlington, 
Texas 76013. 

• •• 
Stanley D. McKeever (BS) is director of 

social services at High Plains Children's 
Home and Family Services. He is married to 
the former Becky Ann Robison (BA) and 
they live at 5348 Whitney, Amarillo, Texas 
79110. 

• •• 
Edward Lee Pierce (BS) is audit manager 

with Arthur Andersen & Company" He and 
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The University Business Team competed in the National Invitational Business Games at Emory University in Atlr;mta, Ga., to win quan­
titatively in their industry. Members are from left (front) M ark Weeks, Pam Holladay, Brant Holladay, (back) Faculty Sponsor Jim Henderson, 
Curtis Clements, Susan Kemp, Hal Hess, and Faculty Sponsor David Burks. 

his wife, the former Jo Ellen Grieb (BA'79), 
reside at 1710 Meadow Green Dr., Missouri 
City, Texas 77489. 

••• 
Susan Smith McCollum (BSN) is a 

registered nurse in the recovery rooin at 
Piedmont Hospital. She and husband, 
Malcom (BA'79), live at 202 Jody Lynn 
Court, Woodstock, GA. 30188. 

••• 
Lany H. Waller (BS) is part-time in­

structor in the Biology Department at the 
University of Central Arkansas, Conway. He 
resides at 341 Ash (North Apt.), Conway, 
72032. 

••• 
Anne Waites Hammond (BA) teaches at 

Greater Atlanta Christian Schools. She lives 
with husband, Kevin, and children at 2326' 
Goodwood Drive, Marietta, Ga. 30060. 

••• 
Joe David Smith (BS) is a student at 

Louisiana State University in veterinary 
medicine. He and his wife, the former Nora 
Pierce (AA'79), reside at 1837 Pickett, 
Baton Rouge, La. 70808. 

••• 
Curtis Wayne Sparks (BA) is employed 

with Oklahoma Christian College as 
apartment manager of Heritage Heights 
Apartments. FIe is married to the former 
Nedra Jo Smith ('80) and they reside at 
13900 Benson. Road, No. 223, Edmond, 
Okla. 74034. 

••• 
Linda Smith Magee (BA) is a 

homemaker; her husband, Dr. Danny 
Magee, is a veterinarian working for 
Peterson Industries. They' reside with 
daughter, Carrie Leanne, in Decatur, Ark. 
Their address is P.O. Box 211, Decatur, 
72722. " 

••• 
Tommy Lee Tackett (BS) is employed 

with Arkansas Eastman Company as 
chemical technician, Batesville, Ark. His 
wife, the former Nancy Roberts, is technical 
services clerk with the Independence County 
Library. They live at 286 West Baker Street, 
Batesville, 72501. 

••• 
Larry D. Nossaman (BA) is employed with 

Dickinson Press as news editor. His wife, the 
former Susan Horsman (BA), is basic skills 
instructor with Dickinson Public Schools. 
They reside at 265 A, Street, Dickinson, 
N.D. 58601. ' 

HARDING UNIVERSITY 

Levester (Butch) Gardner (BA) is head 
basketball coach at the University of 
Arkansas in Pine Bluff. He is married to the 
former Sheila Patterson (BA). The family 
lives at 1405 Blackhawk Ridge Lane, Pine 
Bluff, 71603. 

••• 
Stan Small (CCP) owns a truck painting 

business. He and his wife, Donna, live at 412 
West Whitmore Ave., Modesto, Calif. 
95351. 

••• 
Patricia Jo Fish (BSN) is a registered 

nurse at Shreveport Medical Center, 
Shreveport, La. She resides at 1014-P Quail 
Creek Road, Shreveport, 71105. 

••• 
Michael Stephen Isenberg (BA) is internal 

auditor with the Public Service Company of 
Oklahoma. He lives at 1351 East 61st, No. 
18F, Tulsa, 74136. 

••• 
Susan Bean Johnson (BA) is a 

homemaker; her husband, Kent (BA'77), is 
an instructor and coach at David Lipscomb 
College. They live at 3704 Crestview Ave., 
Nashville, Tenn. 37215. 

••• 
Kerry Harris (CCP) is employed with Cleo 

Cheek as a salesman for Cheek-Wholesale 
Grocers. He and his wife, Carol, live at 501 
S.E. 4th St., Atkins, Ark. 72823. 

••• 
LaDonna Renee Elliott Myers (BA) is 

employed with the University of Arkansas 
Cooperative Extension Se,rvice. She and 
husband, Gary, reside at 533 Bessie, 
Magnolia, Ark. 71753. 

••• 
Lola Bowen (BSN) completed the master 

of nursing degree at Emory University 
September, 1984, as a clinical nurse 
specialist with family nurse practitioner 
skills. She is employed in the sickle cell 
crisis center at Grady Hospital in Atlanta, 
Ga. She resides at 888 Marion Ave., S.E., 
Atlanta, 30312. 

••• 
, Patricia L. Woods (BSN) works part-time 

as a registered nurse at the Emory 
University Student Health Center. She 
attends Emory full time working toward the 
master's degree in public health. She lives at 
767 Stacey Collrt, Lilburn, Ga. 30247. 

••• 
Gregory W. McCubbin (BS) is employed 

with Tom Brown, Inc., as programming 

manager. He resides at 403 Eastwood, 
Midland, Texas 79703. 

••• 
N. Wayne Brewer (BA) serves as minister 

for the Church of Christ in Osceola, Iowa. 
He and his wife. Susan, live at 416 East 
Grant. Osceola, 50213. 

••• 
James Phillip Johnston is employed with 

Compu-Share. Inc. 'as computer 
programmer. He is married to the former 
Cindy Cline (BA'76) and they reside at 6316 
35th Street, Lubbock, Texas 79407. 

••• 
Suzan Young Starkey (BSN) is staff R.N. 

at Nashville Memorial Hospital, Nashville. 
Tenn. She and her husband, Sidney, live at 
1616 Lethia Drive, Nashville, 37206. 

••• 
Marshall W. Grate (BS) is an attorney 

with the Livingston Law Firm. He and his 
wife, the former Lanette Lawrence (BA), live 
at 7238 Garman Road, Route 2, Auburn. 
Ind. 46706. .*. 

Luther Lee Thornton (BS) is financial 
accountant with Aerospatiale Helicopter 
Corporation. He and his wife, the former 
Jody Kay Baker (BS), live at 1217 West 
Tucker Blvd., Arlington, Texa~ 76013. 

••• 
Linda Hare Glenn (BS) accepts com­

missioned art jobs and does her own craft 
shows; she previously worked for' a craft 
store. She and husband, Michael (BA'79), 
reside at 1168 Forest Vale Lane. Apt. I, 
Norcross. Ga. 30093. 

• •• 
Deborah Jo Owens (BS) is dietitian and 

assistant manager of Waco Center for 
Youth, Waco, Texas. She resides at 203-A 
Turtle Cove RO,ad, Waco, 76711. 

••• 
David L. Huey (BS) is project manager of 

Matrix Architects, Tulsa, Okla. He and his 
wife, Patti, reside at 3042 South Detroit 
Avenue, Tulsa, 74114. 

• •• 
Robert W. Nelson (BS) is owner and 

operator of Nelson & Associates. He is 
married to the former Rebecca Pirtle 
(BSMT'77) and they reside at 1102 East 
10th Street, Jeffersonville, Ind. 47130. 

• •• 
Shauna Lawyer (BS) is legal assistant to 

Murray, Behrens, Taylor & Eblen; she is 
also an actress in the Carpenter Square 

Theatre. She lives at 501 N.W. 116 Street, 
Oklahoma City, Okla:. 73114. 

, ... 
Herbert D. Hartman (MAR) is serving as 

a missionary with his wife. Sheila, in 
Australia. They are sponsored by the 
Eastside Church of Christ in Oklahoma 
City, Okla. The Hartmans' address is P.O. 
Box 683, Campbelltown; New South Wales 
2560, Australia. 

• •• 
Jerry L. Fonville is foreman at D-FW 

Steel in Ft. Worth, Texas. He and his wife, 
Terri, reside' at 2428 Dancy Drive, North, 
Ft. Worth, 76131. 

•• * 
Carl D. Hardie (CCP) serves as minister 

for the East Main Church of Christ, Par­
chment, Mich. He and his wife, Etana, 
reside at 623 Keyes Drive, Parchment, 
49004. 

*** 
Stephen Carl Flatt (BS) is employed with 

CNA 'Insurance Company as 'life sales 
manager for Arkansas.'He and his wife, the 
former Linda Musgrove (BS), live at 1 Tara 
Court, Maumelle, Ark. 72118 . 

••• 
Michael W. Cope (BA) serves as pulpit 

minister for the College Church of Christ, 
Searcy, Ark. He imd his wife, the former 
Diane McKee ('80), reside at 7 Peppertree 
Place, Searcy, 72143 . 

••• 
David R. Baker (BS) is a student at the 

Medical College of Virginia School of Nurse 
Anesthesiology. He and his wife, the former 
Robin Brewer ('80), live at 7 Braeburn 
Drive, Richmond, Va. 23233. 

••• 
Carol French Adams (BA) is a 

homemaker; her husband, Glen (BA'77), is 
clinical specialist with Schultz Lewis Child 
& Family Center, Valparaiso, Ind. They 
reside at 2007 Chamblee, Valparaiso, 
46383. 

• •• 
Susan Denewiler Lindsay (BS) is secretary 

for J. J. Oomrigar/Landman in Denver, 
Colo. She and her husband, Guy, live at 
2286 South Clermont; Denver, 80222. 

• •• 
Timothy R. Albright (BA) is evangelist for 

the Columbiana Church of Christ, 
Columbiana, Ohio. He and his wife. Betty, 
live at 322 Orchard Court, E:olumbiana, 
44408. 

• •• 
Ronnie Huckeba (BA) is athletic director, 

teacher and football coach at Ouachita 
Christian School. Monroe, La. He and his 
wife, the former Peggy Jones ('76), live at 
538 Woodhaven Street, Monroe. 71203. 

• •• 
James C. Beam Jr. serves as evangelist for 

the Poplar & Warner Church of Christ, 
Guthrie, Okla. He is married to the former 
Gena Sue Dyess ('79) and they reside at 401 . 
East Mansur Street, Guthrie, 73044. 

••• 
Karen Moran Goudeau (BA) is a 

homemaker and 'missionary with her 
husband, Eugene (BA'74), to Brazil. They 
are sponsored by the Golf Course Road 
Church of Christ, Midland. Texas. Their 
address is Caixa Postal' 360 - 79.100 
Campo Grande MS Bra~il. 

• •• 
Lani Morgan Beagle (BA) works as a 

secretary at Arkansas Power & Light 
Company. She and her husband, 'Fhad 
(BBA'79), live in Batesville, Ark. Their 
address is P.O. Box 2743, Batesville, 72503. 

••• 
Marcia Copeland Jacks is employed as 

billing analyst with Samsonite Furniture. 
She and her husband, Steve, live at 2518 
Gilbert Street, Murfreesboro, Tenn. 37130. ."'. 

Marla Martin Housby (BA) is Outreach/. 
prevention worker with LaSalle County 
Council for Alcohol/Drug Abuse. She and 
her husband, Robert. live at 730 112 West 
LaFayette, Ottawa, III. 61350. 

(continued on page 18) 
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Math Professor Harmon Brown takes advantage of the warm weather to teach his class outside using the sidewalk as a chalkboard. 

Julie Hall Alexander is a student at the 
University of Texas at Dallas. She and 
husband, Billy, reside at 3619 Casa de Sol, 
Dallas, Texas 75228. 

••• 
Anita Walker Swayne is a graphic artist 

with Colonial Press. She and her husband, 
David, reside at 7491 Macon Highway, 
Watkinsville, Ga. 30677. 

••• 
Mark Fisk (lJA) is a department manager 

at J. C. Penney Company. He is married to 
the former Lori Mitchell (BSN'80) and they 
reside at 806 Somerset Circle, Hanover 
Park, Ill. 60103. 

••• 
Donald C. Eudaly (BA) is manager/­

supervisor of the Denver office of Direct 
Couriers of America. He and his wife, the 
former Suzanne Avance ('82), live at 8423 
Everett Way, Apt. A, Arvada, Colo. 80005. 

••• 
Larry H. Oehlerts (BA) is serving as 

religious programer for the chaplain in the 
U.s. Navy. He and his wife, Myrna, live ,at 
7752 East Van Buren Ave., Port Orchard, 
Wash. 98366. 

••• 
Woodie N. Rowe (BA) is a certified public 

accountant with Frasier, Dean & Howard. 
He is married to the former Darla Lemmons 
(BA'79) and they reside at 1900 Randolph 
Place, Nashville, Tenn. 37215. 

•• * 
John David Greene is a civil engineer willi 

Lehman-Roberts, Memphis, Tenn. He and 
his wife, the former Karen Christofferson 
(BA '77), live at 4612 Ross Road, Memphis, 
38115. 

*.* 
Linda Tipton (BA) and her husband, 

Wimon, are missionaries to Botswana, 
Africa, sponsored by the Southwest Church 
of Christ in Tigard, Organ. Their address is 
9725 S.W. Durham Road, Tigard, 97223. 

•• * 
Steven Mardis is employed with TV A, 

division of operation support in power as 
painter foreman. He and his wife, Ruth, 
reside at Route 4, Box 333B, Moulton, Ala. 
35650. 

• *. 
Merrill F. Klemm (BS) is an account 

executive with AT&T. His wife, Vicki, is 
financial planner for the city of Cedar 
Rapids. They reside at 1908 Washington 
Ave., SE, Cedar Rapids, Iowa 52403. 

••• 
William J. Wheeler is employed . with 

Allstate Insurance Company as district 
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underwriter, city of Nashville, Tenn. He 
lives with his wife, Brenda, and daughter, 
Holly Elizabeth, at 3865 Scotwood Drive, 
Nashville, Tenn. 37211. 

••• 
Terry B. Rothrock works at the 

Willowbrook Country Club and attends the 
University of Texas at Tyler with a major in 
industrial technology. He and his wife, Lois, 
reside at 4207 Suel, Tyler, Texas 75702. 

••• 
Robert T. Akins (lJA) is teacher and head 

coach at Hernando High School, Hernando, 
Miss. He and wife, Ian. live at 350 Vaiden 
Drive. Hernando, 38632. 

• •• 
Iohn D. Gibbs is engineering news editor 

with the Universlty of Florida College of 
Engineering. He and bis wife, 10 Ann, reside 
at 378-7 Maguire Village, Gainesville, Fla. 
32603. 

••• 
Timothy W. Harper is vice president of 

operations for Office Management Systems. 
He and his wife, Linda, live at 311 Swoope 
Drive West, Columbus, Miss. 39702. 

• •• 
Ralph L. Harris Jr. is a soil con­

servationist with the USDA Soil Con­
servation Service. He and wife, Claudette, 
reside at 110 South Fourth, McGehee, Ark. 
71654. 

• •• 
Eugene D. Cook (BS) is senior com­

mercial underwriter with United States 
Fidelity & Guaranty. He is married to the 
former Joy Williams ('82) and they live at 
11407 Vista Haven drive, Pineville, N.C. 
28134. 

••• 
Donald "Buzz" Ball (BA) is managing 

editor of The Pratt Tribune newspaper in 
Pratt, Kan. He and his wife, the former 
Lanette Mahle -(BA), reside at 802 East 5th, 
Pratt, 67124 . 

CLASS OF 1979 
Sherry L. Wood (BA) teaches seventh 

grade mathematics in the public schools in 
Little Rock, Ark. -She lives at 12605 Timber 
Bend, Little Rock, 7221 L . - ••• 

Charles A. Florez (BA) has been named 
director of marketing for the Big' Eight , 
accounting firm of Coopers & Lybrand, San 
Diego office. 

CLASS OF 1980 
JameS Bristol is a first year law student at 

Pepperdine University School of Law. He is 
married to the former Iennifer Boustead 
(BSN'81) who is staff nurse at Pepperdine 
University Health Center. The couple lives at 
885 St. Charles Drive, No.6, Thousand 
Oaks, Calif. 91360. 

• •• 
Donald S. Thurman (BBA) is systems 

analyst with the United Nations Industrial 
Development Organizati~n in Vienna, 
Austria. He and his wrre, the former Carol 
Jenetha Brown (lJA) have two daughters, 
Erica Ann and Kira Leigh. The family's 
address is Baumergasse 1512, A-1210 
Vienna, Austria, Europe. 

• •• 
Steven G. Dumas (lJSW) received the 

master's degree in Bible in 1984 from 
Abilene Christian University. He and his 
wife, Caroline, are serving as missionaries to 
Thessalonike, Greece. Steve spent 15 years 
in Greece while his parents served as 
missionaries from 1963-78. His address 
is P.O. Box 11203, Station 54110, 
Thessalonike. 

CLASS OF 1981 
·M. Dean Stanley (BA) is teacher and high 

school basketball coach at Central Public 
Schools, Iudsonia, Ark. His wife, the former 
Debbie Arms (BA'82), is elementary 
resource teacher in the same school system. 
The couple resides at Route 1, Box 260, 
Judsonia, 72081. 

•• * 
Cynthia Floyd Wells is living in Dayton, 

Ohio where her husband, Richard, was 
promoted to senior project engineer, 
engineering analysis at Delco Moraine 
General Motors' Corporation. The couple 
resides with their daughter, Aimee, at 6675 
Dial Drive, Dayton, 45424. 

• •• 
Kevin L. Feeler (BBA) is marketing 

coordinator with The Earth Technology 
Corporation, Long Beach, Calif. He is 
married to the former Sheree Rene Farrell 
(AA) who is sales assistant with Dean Witter 
Reynolds, Inc., Long Beach. The couple 
lives at 2722 East lOth St., No. 204, Signal 
Hill, Calif. 90806. 

CLASS OF 1982 
Dale R. Lawrence (lJBA) is an accountant 

with TENNECO, Houston, Texas. His wife, 
Evi, is junior high language arts-teacher at 
Westbury Christian School. They live at 
9200 Bissonnet, Apt. 905, Houston, 77074 . 

••• 
Rodney B. Crownover (BSW) is intake 

specialist with the United Methodist 
Children's Home, Little Rock, Ark. He lives 
at 1701 N. Bryant, Apt. 63, Little Rock, 
72207. 

• •• 
Robert Ulrey (lJBA) recently passed the 

CPA exams in' Dallas, Texas. Employed by 
Arthur. Young & Company he -is a senior 
accountant in charge of audits. He has been 
with the company for three years. He resides 
at 9236 Church Road, Apt. 2091, Dallas, 
75231. 

••• 
David Kenser (CCP) received the B.A. 

degree December 14 in Religious' Studies 
from S.t. Mary of ,the Plains College in 
Dodge City" Kan. He graduated magna cum 
laude with a 3.82, GPA. He and his ~, 
Gayla, reside at 1016 Santa Fe, Scott City, 
Kan. 67871. ' 

••• 
Melinda Preble Swann (lJBA) has ac­

cepted a new job as fund accountant for 
AIM Management, a money market/­
mutual fund management corporation. Her 
husband, 'Mark, is an accountant with 
Texas Eastern Corporation. The couple 
resides at 12351 Attlee Qrive, Houston, 
Texas 77077. 

••• 
Stephen W. Lomax (BSN) has been 

promoted in the U.S. Army to the rank of 
first lieutenant. Lomax is the recovery room 
head nurse at Fort Leonard Wood, Mo. He 
and his wife, Kim, reside at 36 Williams, Ft . 
Leonard Wood, Mo. 65473: 

••• 
Meli$sa Redding (lJSN) is a medical 

missionary in Belize, Central America 
working as a nurse with Health Talents 
International. Her address is P.O. Box 144, 
Belmopan, Belize. 

••• 
John W. Walker (lJA) completed un­

dergraduate pilot training and received his 
wings March 12. His wife, the former Iune 
Wood (lJSN'83), works as a home health 
nurse. The couple resides at 1922 East 
Cherry, Enid, Okla. 73701. 

• •• 
Second Lt. Marvin Hill (BSN) joined the 

Air Force after working in a civilian hospital 
in Arkansas, as did his identical twin, 
Melvin (BSN), who is also a second 
lieutenant. Marvin is an intensive care unit 
staff nurse at Wilford Hall Medical Center 
in San Antonio, Texas. Melvin is a nurse In 
the cardio thorasics ward at Wilford Hall 
Medical Center, Lackland AFB, Texas. 
Marvin lives at 7520 Potrainco, Apt. 1713, 
San Antonio, Texas 78251. Melvin is 
married to the former Susal). Housley 
(AA'80) and they reside at 4900 Medical, 
Apt. 1308, San Antonio, Texas 78229. 

CLASS OF 1983 

Shelia Tyler Haley (AA) is senior secretary 
at Oklahoma State University, Stillwater. 
Her husband, Donald Dean, Jr., is a 
student. The couple lives at 402 Newport, 
Perkins, 74059 . .*. 

Lee McCain (BBA) has been promoted to 
assistant store manager at Beall-Ladymon's 
Pierre Bossier Mall store, Bossier City, La. 
McCain resides at 2205 Beckett St., No.7, 
Bossier City, 71111 . 

.** 
Laura Jo Moore (BSN) is a registered 

nurse wQrking at St. Vincent Intjrmary in 
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Little Rock, Ark. She lives at 1701 Westpart 
Dr., No. 82, Little Rock, 72204. 

••• 
Elizabeth J. Blake (BA) is employed with 

the University of Kansas Medical Center in 
Kansas City, Kan. as a dietetic technician. 
She lives at 11118 West 99th Place, 
Overland Park, Kan. 66214. 

••• 
Zachary A. Van Tassel (BBA) is employed 

with Universal Software Associates as chief 
programmer, Searcy, Ark. His wife, the 
former Kimberlee Wilkinson (BA'84), is a 
legal secretary. They reside at Route 4, Box 
53, Searcy, 72143. 

••• 
Mari E. McMinn (BA) teaches first griule 

at Fuller Elementary School, Little Rock, 
Ark. She resides at 701 Green Mountain 
Drive, No. 105, Little Rock, 72211. 

••• 
Chris Kelley (BBA) is working at Twin 

City Warehouses in Winston-Salem, N.C. as 
an operations analyst. His wife, 'the former 
Beth Kirk (BBA), is a customer service 
representative with Centel Business 
Systems. They reside at 5979 Honeycomb 
Lane, Pfafftown, 27040. 

CLASS OF 1984 
F. DeWayne Pettie (BBA) is systems 

analyst with W. R. Grace & Company, 
. Memphis, Tenn. He lives at 4381 Calypso 

Court, Apt. 2, Memphis, 38118. 
••• 

Scott P. Stevens (BBA) is employed with 
Republic Bank, Dallas, Texas. He resides at 
8303 Skillman St., No. 417, Dal1u, 75231. 

, ... ' 

Air Force Capt. Robert E. Price (BSN) 
has been chosen junior officer of the quarter 
for the 13th Air Force at Clark Air Base, 
Phillippines. He is a clinical nurse at the 
U.S. Air Force Regional Medical Center. 

••• 
William Joseph (Joe) Godley (MAR) 

serves as minister of youth and family for 
the Sycamore View Church of Christ, 
Memphis, Tenn. His wife, Cynthia, is 
receptionist and bookkeeper for Dr. 
Timothy 1. Hacker, a dentist. The couple 
lives with their two children, Joyce Cristen 
and Emily Jeanna, at 3951 Twin Lakes 
Road, Memphis, ' 38128. 

••• 
Too J. Martin (BBA) assumes the 

responsibilities of second assistant manager 
of Beal1-Ladymon, Bossier City, La. Martin 
resides at 2579 Airline Dr., No. 5-D, Bossier 
City, 71111. 

••• 
Earl Clevenger (M.Ed.) is assistant 

director of Foothills Vocational School, 
Searcy, Ark. His wife, Gail, is a secretary at 
Harding University. They reside with their 
three children - Bert, Jason and Amie - at 
121 Indian Trail, Searcy, 72143. 

••• 
Mark D. Fonville (BFA) is graphic artist 

with Club Products Company, Jacksonville, 
Ark. He also does free lance graphic art 
work. He and his wife, Kim" a student at 
Harding, live at 900 112 Merritt St., Searcy, 
72143. 

••• 
Jack C. Boersma (BA) resides at 730 West 

Sixth Street, Boonevil1e, Ark. 72927. 
••• 

Tammie Mathis (AA) is a computer 
operator with First South Bank in Pine 
Bluff, Ark. She recently received an 
achievement award for completing a course 
in computers and data processing, making 
one of the top scores. Tammie lives at 4103 
West 30th Ave., Pine Bluff, 71603. 

••• 
Betty Smith Slaughter (BA) and husband, 

Roy, own Smith Monument Company in 
Searcy, Ark. Their address is 806 East Race 
Ave., Searcy, 72143. 
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Daniel A. Gillett (BBA) is staff ac­
countant with Price Waterhouse, Dal1as, 
Texas. His wife, the former Barbie 
Pickhardt ('86) is a student at the University 
of Texas in Dallas. The couple resides at 
18333 Roehampton, No. 223, Dallas, 75252. ••• • 

Titia Arledge Dunn (BS) is secretary at 
the Harding University Recording Center. 
She and her husband, Rick, and son, Todd 
Jeffery, live on campus. Their address is Box 
1606, Station A, Searcy, 72143. 

••• 
Dale A. Vernon (CCP'84) is evangelist 

with the Church of Christ in St. Joe, Ark. He 
has been selected to a position on the Six 
Year Planning Committee for the St. Joe 
Public Schools and also serves on the Board 
of S.P.G. Volunteer Fire Department. He is 
married to the former Janice Carter (BA'82) 
who does substitute teaching for the public 
schools. The couple has a son, Zachary 
Isaac. The family's address is P.O. Box 96, 
St. Joe, 72675. 

••• 
Mary Kay Arnold is , employed with 

Management Recruiters. She resides at 
5338 Hollyview Dr., Houston, Texas 77091. 

••• 
Larry Shay is a student at Arkansas Tech 

University in Russellville, 'Ark. He ' was 
selected to Outstanding Young Men of 
America in 1984. His wife, the former Jeri 
Ann Massia (BA'82), is a school teacher. 
The couple lives at 1310 North Hartford, 
Russellville, 72801. 

••• 
Jeffrey Scott Stidman (BS) is a student at 

the University of Arkansas Medical School 
in Little Rock. He lives at 616A South Pine, 
Little Rock, 72205. 

••• 
Tammy Heinold Smith (BBA) is working 

toward the master's degree in accounting at 
Harding. Her husband, David, is a student 
at Harding. Their address is Box 1082, 
Statioo A, Searcy, Ark. 72143. 

••• 
Barry James Rosie (CCP) serveS with his 

wife, Stacy, as a houseparent at Southern 
Christian Home, Morrilton, Ark. They 
anticipate beginning work with the Luo 
tribe in Kenya, East Africa bv June of 1~. 

Their address is P.O. Box 556, Morrilton, 
72110. 

••• 
Michael B. Wood (BA) is a special 

education teacher with Searcy Middle 
School. He also serves as youth minister for 
the Church of Christ in Beedeville, Ark. His 
address is Briarwood Apt. 3B-1, Searcy, 
72143. 

••• 
Glenn L. Dillard (BBA) is executive sales 

representative with Colonial Life & Ac­
cident Insurance Company. Searcy. Ark. He 
is married to the former Susan Wright who 
is a junior at Harding University. The 
couple lives at 1503 Fox Drive. Searcy. 
72143. . 

••• 
Ronnie J. Mandrell (BA) is a self­

employed farmer. He lives at Route 1, 
Judsonia, Ark. 72081. 

••• 
Lisa Diana Maness (BA) is attending the 

.University of Arkansas at Little Rock 
working toward the master's degree in 
communicative disorders. She has a 
traineeship at Alexander Human 
Development Center in Alexander, Ark. She 
resides at 225 Keightley Drive. C-2!, Little 
Rock. 72207. 

••• 
Randy Austin is an electrician with 

Kaufman Electric Company, Hot Springs. 
Ark. He received the Glenwood Fire 
Department award for devoted and in­
valuable service rendered to the city of 
Glenwood. ,His address is P.O. Box 382, 
Glenwood, 71943. 

••• 
Glenda Pollard Bennett is a houseparent 

for South Plains Children Shelter along with 
her husband, Timothy, who attends Sunset 
School of Preaching, Lubbock. Texas. The 
couple lives at 1102 58th, No. 146, Lubbock. 
79412. 

••• 
Anne Marie McPike (BBA) is auditor for 

the Army Audit Agency, Indianapolis, Ind. 
She . resides at 2404 Penny Court, In­
dianapolis. 46229. 

••• 
Kerry Branum completed Chinese 

linguist training 'at the Defense Language 

Jim McGuigglln exhorts lin audience o/you"g people duri"g the an"1UIl Youth Forum. 

. Institute and attended the University of 
Maryland. He is a linguist with the United 
States Marine'Corps, Okinawa, Japan. He is 
married to the former Linda Bolls (BA'81) 
and they have a son. Justin Adam. The 
family's address is c/o Road and Ranch 
Supply, Box 7, Belgrade. Mont. 59714. 

••• 
Robert Collins (BS) is data technician 

with the Duke University Medical Center, 
Durham, N.C. He is married to the former 
Lyleen Storch ('83) who is also a data 
technician with Duke University Medical 
Center. The couple lives at 311 South 
LaSalle, Apt. 15-B, Durham, 27705. 

• •• 
DavidF. Swanson (BBA) is working 

toward the master's degree in accounting at 
Harding University. He also works as ac­
countant for Audio Express. Searcy, He is 
married to the former Lisa Oglesby (BBA) 
who is self-employCld in the word processing 
business. Their address is Box 188. Station 
A, Searcy. Ark. 72143. 

••• 
JoJean Baker Smith (AA) is a homemaker 

while her husband. Chuck,· attends Harding 
University. They reside with their daughter, 
Desarae Jean, at 1703 E. Market St .• Apt. 
40, Searcy. Ark . . 72143. 

• •• 
J. Brent Lents received the B.S. degree in 

chemical engineering in 1984 from the 
University of Missouri at Rolla. He is a 
teaching assistant at Ohio State University 
working toward the M.S. degree. His wife, 
the former Elizabeth Matheny, also attends 
Ohio State University. The couple is at 
home at 302 East Tompkins, Columbus, 
Ohio 43202. 

••• 
Richard O. Supplee (BA) is a sales 

representative with Consumer Hearing 
Consultants, Dover, N.H. He is also at­
tending the University of New Hampshire as 
a graduate student in English. He is married 
to the former Cathryn Camp (BA) and they 
reside at 19 First Street, Apt. 5, Dover, 
03820. 

••• 
Janie Stanton Adams received the B.B.A. 

degree in 1984 from Belmont College. She is 
a homemaker. Her husband, Alan Dale 
(BBA'82), is ' self-employed as a 
homebuilder/contractor. The couple lives at 
1012 B Clifton Lane, Nashville, Tenn. 
37204. 

• •• 
Janet R. Morthole (BBA) is systems 

engineer with Electronic Data Systems, st. 
Louis, Mo. She resides at 929 Brookside 
Ave., Apt. A. St. Louis, 63119. 

••• 
Mary Ruth Eudaly (BA) teaches sixth 

grade at Rolla, 65401. 
• •• 

Dee York (BBA) is office manager of the 
advertising department of Dillard's, Inc., 
Little Rock, Ark. She resides at 3 Pickering 
Drive. Little Rock, 72211. 

••• 
David Redding (BA) is attending 

Southern Methodist University working 
toward the master's degree in physical 
education. His wife, the former Kay Wilson 
(BBA'81). is secretary to the president of 
Trammell Crow Company. The coliple 
resides at 9362 Holloway Way Road, Dallas. 
Texas 75220 . 

• •• 
Penny Davison Cassetty holds the 

associate degree from Indiana University; 
she is a homemaker. Her husband, Douglas, 
is plant watch engineer with Northern 
Indiana Public Service Company. The 
couple lives at 205112 West Indiana Street. 
Kouts. Ind. 46347. 

••• 
Mitchell L. Washer (BBA) is employed 

with General Motors as production 
engineer. He is married to the former 
Debbie Ducharme (BBA) who is 
bookkeeper/secretary at Oakland Mall 
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Shell. They reside at 24605 Harmon, St. 
Clair Shores, Mich. 48080. 

••• 
Marci Jolene Williams Crump (BA) is 

elementary teacher and high school coach at 
Shreve Christian Schools, Shreveport, La. 
Her husband, Richard (BBA), is a 
management trainee with Brookshires 
Grocery. They live at 8200 Pines Road, Apt. 
2905, Shreveport, 71129. 

••• 
Tim Sc()tt (BA) is a high school teacher in 

the public schools, Kotzebue, Alaska. His 
wife', the former Lajarle Hogan (BA'82), is 
an elementary school teacher. Their address 
is Box 894, Kotzebue, 99752. 

••• 
LeAnn Welch (BS) is employed as 

manager of the Best Western King's Inn, 
Searcy, Ark. She lives at Route 1, Box 189A, 
Beebe, 72012. 

••• 
Diana Thurman is a staff artist with The 

Brock Corporation, Neosho, Mo. She holds 
a B.F.A. degree in graphic design from the 
University of Missouri. Diana resides at 
Route 7, Box 395, Neosho, 64850. 

••• 
Michael Shannon Simpson (BBA) is 

assistant manager trainee with Wal-Mart 
Stores, Inc., Crockett, Texas. He resides at 
508 South Fifth, Crockett, 75835. 

••• 
Karen J. Garrett (BA) does private 

tutoring in algebra and does substitute 
teaching in elementary and in physical 
education. She lives at 2020 South 
Dixieland Road, Rogers, Ark. 72756. 

••• 
Angel Bell Carter (BSN) is a registered 

nurse at St. Thomas Hospital, Nashville, 
Tenn. Her husband, David (BA'82), is an 
elementary teacher at Nashville Christian 
School. The couple resides at 106 'Harpeth 
Hills Drive, Franklin, Tenn. 37064. 

••• 
Charles G. Tucker earned the B,S. degree 

in 1984 in political science from Florida 
State University. He sells real estate and is a 
partner in Silver Salarium Sun Systems, . 
Panama City, Fla. He resides at 1029 : 
Huntingdon Road, Panama City, 32405. 

••• 
Richard A. Hall (BBA) is systems 

engineer with Electronic Data Systems, 
Texarkana, Ark. He is married to the 
former Peggy Haines (BBA) and they reside 
at 1400 East 35th Street, Apt. 204, 
Texarkana, 75502. 

••• 
Cheryl Ann Arnold (BS) does substitute 

teaching at Fort Zumwalt Senior High 
School, O'Fallon, Mo. She lives at 25 South 
Boxwood, O'Fallon, 63366. 

••• 
Marsha E. Kearley (BA) is employed with 

Alabama Christian College as executive 
secretary to the vice president of 
development. She lives at 419 Polk Street, 
Montgomery, Ala. 36107. ... , 

Ron Bruns (BA) and his wife, the former 
Susan Fruehauf (BA) reside at 5872 Pinon 
Street, Huntington Beach, Calif. 92649. 

••• 
Juanita Elliott (BS) is attending Memphis 

State University working toward the 
master's degree in management. She resides 
at 3517 Tall Oaks Circle, Apt. 8, Memphis, 
Tenn. 38118. 

••• 
Janis Copeland Ragsdale works as a 

secretary in the School of Business, Harding 
University. Her husband, Scott (BBA), is a 
graduate student at Harding. They live at 
1201 East Moore Ave., Searcy, 72143. 

••• 
Anthony Cornine (CCP) is an industrial 

insulator. He resides with his wife, 'Patricia, 
and two children, Katie and Kevin, at 1300 
East 25th Terrace, Lawrence, Kan. 66046. 

••• 
Tyonia Lynn' Pipkin (BBA) is a depart-

Pll8c20 

ment manager at Dillards, North Little 
Rock, Ark. She lives at 1309 South Pine, 
Cabot, 72023. 

• •• 
Molly Mertz (BSN) is a registered nurse at 

.Medical Center HoSpital, Tyler, Texas. She 
lives at 1717 Shiloh Road, No. 112, Tyler 
75703. 

••• 
Kimberly Asbill Hensarling (AA) is 

employed as secretary at Sweet Publishing 
Co., Ft. Worth, Texas, Her husband, Randy 
(BBA'83), is credit analyst with Texas 
American Bank. The couple resides at 6429 
Stardust Drive South, Ft. Worth, 76148. 

••• 
Susan Laree Still (BSN) is a registered 

nurse at the University of Arkansas for 
Medical Sciences, Little Rock. She works in 
the neonatal intensive care unit and will be 
taking a neonatal critical care course in 
April. Susan lives at 501 Napa Valley Drive, 
Apt. 810, Little Rock, 72211. ' 

• •• 
Ronald L. Kohlbrand (BS) is a dental 

student at the University of Tennessee. His 
home address is 1415 Eddy Street, Merritt 
Island, Fla. 32952. 

• •• 
Angela Pyland East (BBA) is an ac­

countant with Barnhart Company, Houston, 
Texas. Her husband, Greg (BBA'83), is vice 
president of Eastway Products. The couple 
resides at 13222 Noblecrest, Houston, 
77041. 

••• 
Melanie Ann Kearley (I~SW) is a social 

worker with the Hancock County Depart­
ment of Public Welfare, Bay St. Louis, Miss. 
She resides at 103 Elena Court, Bay St. 
Louis, 39520. 

••• 
Jennifer Jayne Armstrong Siebold (BSN) 

is a registered nurse at Centinela Hospital, 
Inglewood, Calif. Her husband, Kent ('85), 
is a student at Pepperdine University in 
Malibu. The couple lives at 12706 Venice 
Blvd., Apt. 23, Mar Vista, 90066. 

••• 
Patricia Louise Purdom (BSN) is a nurse 

in orthopedics at Nashville Memorial 
Hospital, Madison, Tenn. She is a member 
of the American Nurses Association and 
assistant basketball coach of Madison 
Church of Christ girls senior high team. She 
lives at 651 Star Blvd., Madison, 37115. 

••• 
Terrence R. Yates (BS) is a medical . 

student at the University of Arkansas, Little 
Rock. He resides at 411 North Cedar, Little 
Rock, 72205. 

••• 
Byron Carlock (BBA) is doing graduate 

work in international finance at the Chinese 
University of Hong Kong. He will return to 
Arthur Young in Dallas as' staff accountant 
in May, 1985. His address is clo LA.S.P. 
United College, Chinese University of Hong 
Kong, Shatin, New Territoreis, Hong Kong. 

••• 
Shelly Luna holds the B.S. degree in 

home economics from Memphis State 
University. She teaches home economics in 
the Memphis City Schools, Memphis, Tenn. 
Shelly's address is 2737 Curtis, Memphis" 
38118. 

••• 
Michael Louis Gulley (BA) serves as 

minister for the Church of Christ in Horatio, 
Ark. His wife, the former Patricia Moreland 
(BA'83), does substitute teaching. The 
couple's address is P.O. Box 1, Horatio, 
71842. 

••• 
Donna Summerhayes Bailey (BA) does 

substitute teaching in the public schools in 
Grinnell, Iowa. Her husband, Daniel (BS), is 
computer programmer with Grinnell 
Mutual Reinsurance Company. The couple 
is at home at 615 East Street, Apt. 3, 
Grinnell, 50112. 

• •• 
Ronald G. Patterson (BBA) is a 

programmer with Capbanc Computer, 

Don Hutson makes a point during his presentation on "Leadership Makes the Difference." 
More than 500 managers and business people attended the Management Seminar. 

Corporation (Capital Bank), Baton Rouge, I 

La. His wife, Fonda, is youth program 
organizer with the YMCA. The couple 
resides at 1860 Blvd. De Province, Apt. 11, 
Baton Rouge, 70816. 

• •• 
Kern Johns (BBA) is a' management 

trainee with Wal-Mart Stores, Malvern, 
Ark. He resides with his wife, the former 
Brenda McDaniel (BA'73). and son, Jeremy, 
at 810 Schneider Drive, Malvern, 72104 . 

••• 
Alice Louise Coburn (BA) does substitute 

teaching in the Harrisburg, ,Ark. public 
school system. She lives at 203 West Griffin, 
Harrisburg, 72432 . 

••• 
Tonita L. Regier (BS) teaches at Kinder­

Care Learning Centers, Inc., Lincoln, Neb. 
She is at home at 1601 South 23rd, Lincoln, 
68502. 

••• 
Cynthia L. Brazzel (BA).is a teChnical 

writer with Electronic Data Systems Corp., 
Sacramento, Calif. She lives at 9238 
Sungold Way, Sacramento, 95826. 

••• 
Becky Lynn McHan (AA) is a legal 

secretary for Glankler Brown law firm, 
Memphis, Tenn. She' resides at 5528 
Woodlawn, Memphis; 38134 . 

••• 
Jeffrey 'f(. Sutherland (BA) is field 

engineer with Avery Mays Construction 
Com'pany, DallaS, Texas. He resides at 1717 
Lorraine, Plano, 75074. 

••• 
Cathie Sams Cooper received the B.S. 

. degree in fashion merchandising from 
Abilene Christian University in 1984. She is 
sales associate with O'Neils Department 
Store, Akron, Ohio. Her husband, John 
(BA'82), is editor and researcher with World 
Christian Broadcasting. The couple lives at 
1321 Weathervane Lane, Apt. 2D, Akron, 
44313. 

• •• 
Mark S. McCoy (BBA) is architectural 

representative with Fleetwood Aluminum 

Products, Inc., Brea, Calif. He and his wife, 
Tammy, reside at 1249 Deerpark Drive, 
Apt. 264, Fullerton, 92631. 

BIRTHS 
Son, Richard Ian, to Russell (BA'78) and 

Barbara Hoover (BSN'79) Porter November 
11, 1984. The family lives at 2510 New 
Orleans, No. 122, Dallas, 75235. 

Daughter, Claire Michele, to David 
(BA'81) and Mardee Baker (BA'80) 
McAnulty December 24, 1984. The family 
resides at 1744 Myrtledale Ave., Baton 
Rouge, La. 70808 . 

Daughter, Katie, to Frank (BA'82) and 
Robin Solley (BA'82) Barker July 6, 1984. 
Frank is employed with Solley Construction 
Company as a salesman and the family 
resides at 2201 Lancelot Drive, Decatur, 
Ala. 35603. 

Daughter, Anna Grace, to William 
(BS'66) and Harriet Tucker January 4 in 
Searcy, Ark. She joins Belle- and Will. 
William is employed with the development 
staff of Harding University. The family's 
mailing address is P.O. Box 932, Station A, 
Searcy, 72143. 

Son, Lewis Keith, to Kerwin and Kristie' 
Fair ('86) Smith January 1 in Searcy, Ark . 

Son, Jake Randall, to Randy (BS'77) and 
Christi Turner (BA'79) Reeves December 
14, 1984. The family resides at 10 Whip­
poorwill, Searcy, Ark. 72143. 

Twins - Adam Michael and Aaron 
Thomas - to Steve (BA.'76) and Donna 
Bates (BA'75) Kent November 14, 1~84. 
Adam and Aaron join brother, David. me 
family is at home at 125 South 12th, Beech 
Grove, Ind. 46107. 

Son, Caleb Ranger, to Michael (BS'76) 
and Kathleen Caldwell (BA'76) Lowery May 
29, 1984. He joins brothers, Benjamin and 
Joseph. The family resides at 3527 Ventura 
Road, S.W., Huntsville, Ala. 35805. 

Daughter, Erin Rose, to Harvey and Gail 
Linder ('76) Allen August 6, 1984. Their 
address is Route 3, Box 186, Clinton, S.C. 
29325. 
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Daughter, Kensey Lynne, to Kenny 
(BBA'82) and Donna Humphreys ('SO) 
Harris December 16, 1984. The family 
resides at 965 Sandra, Memphis, Tenn. 
38122. 

Son, Mason Douglas, to Michael (BA'78) 
and Kay White (BA'78) Binns December 13, 
1984. Mike is co-owner of Earth-Tone 
Landscaping and Sprinkler Company. The 
family lives at 601 Ethel Drive, Searcy, Ark. 
72143. 

Son, Eugene Robert Jr., to Rob and 
Deborah Cates (BA' 75) Gerst Janl1aty 4. 
Rob serves 3$ youth minister for the Geyer 
Springs Church of Christ in Little Rock, 
Ark. The family resides at 1819 Gadield 
Court, Little Rock, 72204. 

Son, Richard Caleb, to Richard and Reba 
Ashley (BS'68) Warnock January 9. He joins 
a sister, Ashlea. The family resides at 3512 
King Street, El Dorado, Ark. 71730. 

Son, Ryan Davis, to Cecil P. (BA'76) and 
Kathy Wilson III June 19, 1984. They live at 
10040 N.E. 201st, Bothell, Wash. 9S011. 

Son, Justin Matthew, to Charles and Ruth 
Slinkard (BA'70) Fultz September 16. He 
joins brother, Jeremy. The family resides at 
205 North Devon, Sherwood, Ark. 72116. 

Son, AlIron Mark, to Mark (BA'SO) ana 
Kathy Clarke (BA'SO) Dillard January 30. 
Aaron joins sister, Karla. The family lives at 
865 Scott Lake Road, Pontiac, Mich. 48054. 

Dal1ghter, Sara Jean, to James (BS'69) 
and Lenora Rivoire (BA'71) Word 
December 31, 1984. Their address is P.O. 
Box 600, Tahlequah, Okla. 74464-0600. 

Dal1ghter, Amanda Brooke, to Layne 
('79) and Donna Rl1miner ('79) Adams 
August 21, 1984. The family lives at 512 
North Morgan, Moore, Okla. 73160. 

Dal1ghter, Erin Elizabeth, to Larry ('76) 
and Jane Deacon (BSN'77) Archer 
December 22, 1984. The family resides at 
423 McKell, Chillicothe, Ohio 45601. 

Son, Thomas Edward., to' Tommy and 
Jamje Weidner (BSN/7S) Goslin Al1gust 25, 
1984. He joins sister, Mandy. Their address 
is Route 1. Box: 415A, Judsonia, Ark. 72081. 

Son, Tyler Dren.nen, to John (BBA'84) 
8,Dd Dee Helms (,83) Reece January 9. He. 
joins sister, Leslie Nicole. John is store 
manager ror Audi.o Express and Dee is a 
student at Harding University. The family's 
address is Bo~ 1372, Station A, Searcy, Ark. 
72143. 

Son, Jonathon Ross, to Philip and 
Christine Clausen (BSMT'77) Kitchens July 
26, 1984. 

Daughter, Kira Leigh, to Donald 
(BBA'SO) and Carol Brown (BA'SO) 
Thurman August 18, 1984. 

Daughter, Megan Elizabeth. to Curtis 
('86) and Karen Frazier AlWlst 13, 1984. 

Daughter, Shelley Nicole , to Tim 
(BBA'S2) and Elisa Barkley ('84) Brown 
January 17. Tim is an accountant with Pizza 
Inn. Inc .. Dallas, Te,xas. The family resides 
at 1358 Weston Way, Apt. 170, Richardson, 
75OSO. 

Son. Winston Cole, to Winston (' 84) 'and 
Jill Bridges September 25, 1984. Winston is 
a salesman with Brown Manufacturing 
Company, Ozark, AJa. The family lives at 
Route 1, Box 163A., Quitman, Ga. 31643. 

Daughter, Jillian Nicole, to Stephen and 
Brenda' Gamer (SA'78) Paine lanuary 28. 
She joins brother, Stephen Kyle. 

Brenda teaches eleme.ntary physical 
education. Steve is the head baseball coach 
and footbaU coach at South Garland High 
School. The family resides at 8409 
Woodside, Rowlett, Texas 75088. 

Son, Andrew Aaron, to Francis and Rita 
Lynne Metheny (BA'16) Jones November 7, 
1984. He joins brother, Parker. Francis is 
chief administrator of Ouachita Christian 
School. Rita Lynne is a homemaker. The 
family lives at 41 Oakwood Drive, Monroe, 
La. 71203. 

Son, Adam Richard., to Dr. Don and 
Betty Stroup (BSN'77) Green December 29, 
1984. The family lives at 21 Femview Ave .• 
Apt. 12, North Andover, Mass. 01845. 

Son, Chase Jordan, to Bob and Carol Sue 
Kennon ('78) Christie April 23, 1984. He 
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joins brother, Drew. The family lives at 900 
South First, El Dorado Springs, Mo. 64744. 

Daughter, Sharon Denise, to Gene and 
Catherine Drennan (BA'78) Vance October 
22, 1984. She joins brother, David Allen. 
Gene is a senior test engineer with Mostek, 
Inc. The family resides at 5605 Darby Lane, 
Box 73515, The Colony, Texas 75056. 

Daughter, Emily Rose, to Brad (BBA'77) 
and Mary Lee Burcham (BA'7S) Dell April 
26. 1984. The family reSi~es at 37'14 St. 
James. Little Rock, Ark. 72204. 

Daughter, Denae Elise, to Norman .and 
Diana McVey (BA'78) Croucher October 25, 
1984. She joins sister, Nora Anne. The 
family lives at Route 2, Box 41B, Elgin. Ore. 
97827. 

MARRIAGES 
Brenda Lee Caughron (BA'83) to Kevin 

South April 27, 1984 in Memphis, Tenn. 
Brenda teaches part time in the Dayfair 
Daycare day school and substitute teaches 

. for Ifarding Academy of Memphis. Kevill is 
employed with Schering-Plough, Inc. The 
couple resides ·at 2303 Morning V,ista, 
Memphis, 38134. 

Latonia Pasley (BA'83) to Danny K. Piker 
December 28. 1984 in Searcy, Ark. Latonia 
teaches first grade at Central Public 
Schools, judsonia. The cO\~ple resides at 
151S ~st MarJcet, Searcy, 72143. 

Mariann Cox (BA'84) to Brian Casey 
(BA'84) December lS. 1984. The couple 
lives at 5950 SunnydaJe, A4, Beaumont, 
Texas 7110S. 

Melody Ann Mallicote (BBA'82) to 
Vernon Lee Lundquist (BBA'82) September 
22. 1984 'in Irving, Texas. Vern is the Vice 
President of Finance for Gospel Teachers 
Publications in Dallas. Melody works in 
accounts receivable for the Freeman 
Companies in Dallas. The couple lives at 
2210 Cartwright, Irving, 75062. 
. Rebecca Janiece Watson (BA'78) to 

-Richard Seale November 24, 1984 . . Rebecoa 
is employed as medical secretary with . 
Collom & Carney Clinic and Richard is 
computer programmer with Twin City Data 
Service, Inc. They reside at 20 Country 
Lane. Texarkana, Texas 75501. 

Cynthia Ann Marchant (BBA'S2) to John 
Hit:am Reese (BBA;78) January 19 in 
MOl1ntain Home, Ark. Cindi is employed 
with Metropolitan Savings and Loan 
Association of Dallas, Texas. John is with 
the Belew AVeritt Certified Public Ac­
counting Firm in Dallas. 

Jeanne M. Roberts (BS'83) to David 

Walter Parker (BBA'83) January 26 in 
Dallas, Texas. 

Barbara Lyrin Pickhardt ('86) to Daniel 
Allen Gillett (BA'83) October 20, 1984 in 
Conway, Ark. Barbie is a student at the 
University of Texas working toward the 
bachelor's degree in accounting. Dan is a 
staff accountant with Price Waterhouse. 
Th~ couple lives at 18333 Roehampton, No. 
223, Dallas. Texas 75252. 

Andrea Lynn Berry ('86) to Paul 
Brightwell July 14. 1984 in Bedford, Texas. 
Andrea is a <student at the University of 
Texas and serves as news reporter there for 
their news ~etvice. Her husband, P.aul, al.so 
attends there. He is a contractor with J & D 
Contractors. The couple lives at 402 South 
Cooper, ,Apt. 101, Arlington, Texas 76013. 

Angie Wood (BBA'84) to Randy Buttram 
(BS'S3) August 11. 1984. Randy attends 
<iental .school and Angie is employed as a 
software conswtant. 'They reside at 2323 
S.W. 35th Place, No. 7F. Gainesville. Fla. 
32608. 

Kimberly June Fielder (BA'79) to Arthur 
Woods (BBA'8~) February 23 in Little 
Rock, Ark. Kim is employed by the Pulaski 
County School District; Art is a buyer for 
Dillard's Department Stores. 

Jane Powell (BA'62) to David J. Watley 
(BBA'84) August 13, 1983 in San Antonio, 
Texas. Jane is administrative assistant with 
Vernon Savings, Dallas, Texas. David js 
employed with Electronic Data Systems 
Corporation ·as tec~nical writer, marketing 
department. The couple resides at 13450 
Maham Road, Apt. 225, Dallas, 75240. 

SYMPATHY 
Our Sympathy To 

Mrs. J. KelJy Morris. the former Arlene 
Hughes (BSN'78), whose mother, Mrs. A. H. 
Hughes of Augusta, Ark .• died recently. 
Mrs. MOl'l'is lives at 6l16, Eric Lane, 
Montgomery, AJa. 36116. 

Iqck Krug (BA'S3) whose father. Charles 
Krug, died January 3 in Anah.,im. Calif. 
Rick's address is 519 Cherry Tree Lane, 
Anaheim, 92806. 

Ken Pl1l1ey (BA'SO) in the death of his 
fatherJ Leo PuUey, January 3 in Warren. 
Ohio. Ken lives at 148 Cloverdale, Searcy. 
Ark. 72143 . . 

Eddy Jo Hughes Howe (BA '6 7) and 
Phillip Hughes (Academy) in the death of 
their father. Dr. Edwin Hughes (BA'37), 
whodieil Janwu:y 2S in Searcy. Ark. He was 
the brother of Mrs. Robert A. Hughes, the 
former Helen Hugbes ('40) of Nashville, 
Tenn. 

Jewell Woodward Ferren (BA'59) in the 
death of her husband, Sherman (BA'54), 
who died January 1 after an extended 
illness. He was the father of Clifford (BS'77) 
and Louis (BS'83)fi 

The family of James T. McCorkle (BA '47) 
who was killed .in an accident in November, 
1984. He was superintendent of the public 
scHools in Saratoga, Ark. He is the brother 
of Dr. Jack McCorkle (BS'47) and Dr, 
Carter McCorkle ('.58). He is also the uncle 
of Dr. Brandt McCorkle. 

The family of Otis Hanes of Boice City. 
Okla. who died January 11. He is the father 
of LaVera Burkett ('57) and Olan Hanes 
(BA'57). 

The family of Mrs. William A. Chur­
chwell, the former Evelyn Wyatt (MA T'66). 
who died September 27. 1984. 

Billy Earl Williams (BA'53), whose father, 
Hobert Williams, died in January in Heber 
Springs, Ark. \ 

The family of Peggy Matthews (BA'72) 
who died of an aneurysm of the brain while 
jogging January 9 in Memphis. Tenn. She 
taught for eight years at Harding Academy 
in Memphis . . She was the sister of Beth 
Matthews Smith (BA'72) and Dr. David L. 
Matthews (BS'77). 

The family of Charles E. Cigrang (BA'57) 
who. died February 5. He was the father of 
John, Paul, and Jeff (BA'83). 

Robert G. Neil (BA'32) whose wife, the 
former Martha Walker (BA'33). died 
February 15 in Nashville. Tenn. His address 
is 4500 Dustin Lane, Nashville. 37220. 

The family of Robert E. Skelton (MA'53) 
who died February 13 of leukemia. He left 
Bible Chair work in 1977 and at the time of 
his death was employed at Tiner Air Force 
Base. He and his wife, Donna, served as 
mission!lries to Salzburg, Austria from 
February 1956, to June, 1 %3. 

The family of Ancil Davis who died 
December 9. 1984. He was the father of 
John W. Davis (BA'60) of Point Barrow. 
Alaska . 

The family of Van Allen Bradley ('34) who 
died in December 1984.in Scottsdale, Ariz. 
where he had moved· in 1978. 

The family of ' Mildred O'Banion Sharp 
('43) of Jonesboro, Ark. who passed away 
February 19. She was the mother of Kay 
Sharp Veara (BS'70) and the sister of 

I Marguerite O'Banion Benson (BA'42) and 
Maxine O'Banion Cox (BA'46). 

Eva Jo Brown Brammer ('42) whose 
husband. Adrian. passed away suddenly of a 
heart attack December 3, 1984. She resides 
at 613 East Berkeley, Springfield. Mo. 
65807. ' 

Taking advantage of lpeCial topic night c/auel CluJrlene Prock practices the lHuic Itrokes of caUigrtlphy. 
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Butcher Receives NAIA Academic' 
Award; Qualifies For Nationals 

Swimmer Gano 
Butcher has been 
named to the 1985 
Academic AlI-Ameri­
ca team selected by 
the National Associa­
tion of Intercollegiate 
Athletics. 

The. announcement 
was made by Charles 
Eppler, NAIA Direc- Gano Butcher 
tor of Communication. 

Butcher, who has enjoyed an impressive 
junior season, has recorded a 3.71 grade 
point average (on a 4.00 scale) while pur­
suing a major in accounting. 

As a freshman, Butcher earned AII­
Arkansas Intercollegiate Conference status 
and qualified for the NAIA national meet in 
the 200-yard breast stroke. 

Butcher did not compete last year, but the 

5-11, 155 lb. athlete rejoined the team and 
realized a stellar junior season. As a 
member of this year's 400-meter freestyle 
relay team, he again qualified for the 
nationals. 

Of 200 participants in the national meet 
held in Indianapolis, Ind., Butcher ranked 
fifth as an athlete who also excels in the 
academic field. 

Specializing -in the breast stro~e, along 
with the butterfly and backstroke, Butcher 
looks to have one of his brightest seasons 
ahead as a senior. 

"I think Gano realizes that he has 
potential still in front of him," Harding 
coach Jack Boustead said. "Next year he 
could very possibly be a national qualifier in 
two or even three events." 

The 20-year-old Butcher is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. George Butcher of Yamhill, Ore. 
He is an accounting major. 

World University Games Appoint Lloyd; 
Will Serve on Staff for Summer Games 

Harding University track coach Ted 
Uoyd has been named to the United States 
staff for the World University Games 
competition Aug. 29-Sept. 4, in Kobe, 
Japan. 

The appointment from the International 
Competition Committee of The Athletic 
Congress (T AC), through its World 
University Games Selection Subcomittee, 
was made by Berny Wagner, national 
coach! coordinator. 

"It's an Olympic-type competition," 
Uoyd said. "At the international level it's 
right behind the Pan' American Games and 
the Olympics. I feel very fortunate to have a 
chance to fulfill one of my lifetime goals as a 
coach." 

Uoyd will be one of a nine member 
coaching staff to direct the U.S. men and 
women track athletes. Other members are 
Dean Hayes of Middle Tennessee State 
University, Bob Rush of College of San 
Mateo (Calif.), Fred Samara of Santa 
Barbara, Calif., Charles Craig of California 
State-Sacramento, Gary Westerfield of New 
York City, Barbara Jacket of Prairie View 

(Texas), Scott Irving of Florida State and 
Nell Jackson of State University of New 
York. . 

The World University Games is a multi­
sports competition under the jurisdiction of 
the United States Olympic Council. 

Uoyd has more than 25 years of coaching 
experience in intercollegiate and in­
ternational competition. In 1969-70 he 
served as national coach for Panama in the 
Caribbean Games and coached teams for 
the NAIA (Brazil in 1974) and the AAU 
(Mexico in 1979). 

The 49-year-old Uoyd is a past president 
of the NAIA Track Coaches Association 
(1978-80) and served as meet director of the 
NAIA National Championships in 1973 and 
1974. He is a 1957 graduate of Harding and 
earned the M.S. degree in 1964 from the 
University of Mississippi. 

Uoyd is a native of Spring Hill, Kans., 
and is married to the former Marcie 
Crawford of Mountain Home. The couple 
has two children, Rees, a 1984 graduate and 
Melissa, 16. 

BISONS SET DISTANCE PACE - Eddie Neal (left) and Darryl Halbert take over the lead 
in the 5,000 meter run at the Harding Invitational Meet April 20. Neal, a sophomore from 
Griffithville, Ark., ran 15:36.0 and Halbert, a sophomore from Bear Creek, Colo .. recorded 
16:02.0. (photo by Yo Kurabayashi) 
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Lewis Leads Netters - Freshman Vernon Lewis hits an overhand to display the technique 
which has enabled him to compile an 18-2 record at the number one singles position. A native 
of St. Luian, WestIndies, he has led the Bison team to a 20-7 match record this spring. 

Football Captains Elected For '85 Season 
Four seniors have been elected captains of 

the 1985 Harding University football team, 
according to head coach John Prock. 

Named to lead the Bisons are Matt 
Clouser of Huntsville, Ala., Scott Franklin 
of Dunwoody, Ga., Drake Jackson of 
Temple, Texas and Franz Patterson of 
Killeen, Texas. 

"We look to our captains for leadership 
and I think this group of men is capable of 
giving that to us," Prock said. "They are a 
hard-working group and (they will) set a 
good example for our young players." 

A defensive end, Clouser is a two-year 
letterman. Originally an offensive back, he 
was shifted to the defensive team and 
blossomed 'at the linebacker and defensive 

end positions. He plays at 5-11, 200 Ibs. 
Franklin is a versatile 6-1, 230 lb. of­

fensive lineman, having seen playing time at 
the center. guard and tackle positions. A 
three-year letterman, he will see duty at the 
center position for the '85 Bisons. 

In the defensive secondary, Jackson has 
been a solid performer for three seasons. A 
6-0. 175 lb. cornerback, he has recorded 
four career interceptions. In 1984 he 
recorded 32 tackles and 15 assists. 

A 6-2, 214 lb. linebacker, Patterson 
earned a starting role after transferring last 
year from Cis<:o Junior College (Texas). He 
was credited with 47 tackles and 29 assists 
last season. He also recorded an in­
terception. 

Sports Brochure Receives NAIA Award 
A Harding University sports publication, 

"Harding '84-85," has been named the 
recipient of an All-America, citation by the 
National Association of Intercollegiate 
Athletics. 

The announcement was made by Charles 
Eppler, NAIA director of communications, 
at the NAIA National Convention in Kansas 
City, Mo., March 18. 

Harding's brochure entry was the media 
guide for the intercollegiate basketball 
program. It was designed and edited by 
Stan Green, director of public relations. 
Statistical data WaS prepared by student 
assistant Bobby Davidson and production of 
the publication was coordinated by Sandra 

Boaz. 
Harding's 36-page entry was one of 10 

brochures to be recognized in the 
reproduced category. 

Other schools receiving awards were 
Shepherd College (W. Va.), University of 
Southern Colorado, Western Washington 
University. Lubbock Christian College. 
University of Southern Maine, . Southwest 
State University (Minn.). Thomas College 
(Maine), Fairmont State College (W. Va.) 
and the University of Wisconsin-Stevens 
Point. 

The pUblications competition is spon­
sored each year by the NAIA-Sports In­
formation Directors Association. 
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CFL Signs McCoy; 
Will Report To Camp 
With Saskatchewan 

Former Harding University football 
standout Tony McCoy has been signed by 
the Saskatchewan Roughriders of the 
Canadian Football League. 

McCoy, an All-Arkansas Intercollegiate 
Conference selection in 1982, is a graduate 
assistant under Bison coach John Prock. 

"It's a dream come true for me," McCoy 
said. "I've always wanted a chance at 
professional ball. I think I can do it." 

A muscular 5-7, 175 Ibs., McCoy starred 
at tailback for the Bisons where he rushed 
for 1,579 yards in two seasons. He also had 
999 yards on kickoff returns over the 1981 
and 82 seasons after transferring from 
Henderson Junior College (Texas). 

"We're all real tickled about it," Prock 
said. "He's finishing up his student teaching 
this semester so the timing is right and I'm 
really happy he's going to get a shot at it." 

McCoy participated in a tryout camp in 
Shreveport, La., and was one of seven signed 
out of more than 200 athletes. He is to 
report May 20 to Saskatchewan. 

Since completing his eligibility, McCoy 
has been a member of the Bison coaching 
staff, working with the offensive backs and 
scouting. 

"Actually, his time as a coach will 
definitely help him as a player," Prock said. 
"He knows the game and he has the 
physical talent to take advantage of it." 

A native of Texarkana, Texas, McCoy is a 
1979 graduate of Liberty-Eylau High 
School. He was a two-time All-AIC honoree 
in track and was the 200 meter dash 
cnampion in 1982 with a 21.82 time. He was 
the 1982 winner of the Bruce Gaither award 
which recognizes the team's outstanding 
track athlete. 

A physical education major, the 24-year­
old McCoy is the son of Mrs. Patricia Jacobs 
of Texarkana. 

Bison Highlights 

Jim Sutton 

Greg TJ;tompson, a junior second baseman 
from Decatur, Ill., is setting a red hot hit­
ting pace this spring with a .416 batting 
average and 28 runs batted in. Teammate 
Randy Hindman, shortstop from Little 
Rock, Ark., is hitting .375 and has 26 stolen 
bases . . . In track, senior Jim Sutton of 
Marion, Ill., established a new school re­
cord of 182-6Yz in the javelin event. He 
broke a 1968 record of 177-10 set by Wayne 
Stover •.. Golfer Kevin Wise of Pensacola, 
Fla., was the individual medalist in the se­
cond round of the Arkansas Intercollegiate 
Conference golf competition with a 75 at 
the Little Rock Country Club . . . Three_ 
members of the Lady Bisons basketball 
team, senior Lynette Gardner of Andover, 

-Kansas, junior Dena Sims of Pernell, 
Okla., and junior Kim WUkins of Flippin, 
Ark., were nominated for the CoSIDA 
Academic All-America team for District 
VI. Gardner had a 3.25 GPA, Sims had a 
3.40 GPA and Wilkins had a 3.67 GPA. 

HARDING UNIVERSITY 

Collins Earns CoSIDA All-America Academic Award 
Harding basketball player Kenny Collins 

has been named to three post season honor 
teams in recognition of his athletic and 
scholarly accomplishments. 

Collins, a 6-6 junior, has been named to 
the College Sports Information Directors of 
America (CoSIDA) Academic All-America 
first team as well as the Arkansas In­
tercollegiate Conference and the NAIA 
District 17 all-star teams. 

The announcement of the Academic AIl­
America recognition marks the first time a 
Harding athlete has been selected to the 
CoSIDA first team (College Division) honor 
squad. William Chandler ' of Western 
Kentucky announced the awards which 
recognized scholar athletes from NCAA 
Divisions II and III and NAIA schools. 

"The honors are well deserved," Bison 
coach Jess Bucy said. "Kenny is an excellent 
example of the scholar-athlete and we're 
very proud of him." 

A 190 lb. forward/center, Collins led the 
Bisons in scoring this season with a 14.8 
point average and a 6.9 rebound average. In 
his three seasons as a starter on the Bison 
team, he has scored 1,076 points and now 
ranks 14th on Harding's all-time scoring 
list. 

A pre-veterinary medicine major from 
Valley Springs, Ark." he has established 
himself not only as an outstanding athlete 
but a scholar as well. He carries a 3.4 grade -
point average (on a 4.00 scale). 

Dr. Joseph E. Pryor, faculty athletic 
representative, calls his selection "a great 
achievement." Pryor said, "He is a fine 
Christian young man who gives his best not 
only in every game he plays, but also in his 
academic efforts." 

Collins was a unanimous selection to thel 

All-Ale team, which was determined by 
ballot of the· conference basketball coaches. 
He also was one of the top three vote getters 
in the balloting for the NAIA District 17 
honor team. 

A 1982 graduate of Valley Springs High 
School, he led his team to the Class A State 

championships and was named All-State 
and selected as the MVP of the tournament. 

Collins is the son of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Collins of Valley Sp.rings. 

CoSIDA All-America Academic Award Winner: Kenny Collins 

Bisons, Lady Bisons Gain Post Season Recognition 
by Bobby Davidson 

Student Spons Assistant 

The Bisons and Lady Bisons basketball 
teams ended their 1984-85 season with solid 
performances and with several athletes 
earning post-season recognition. 

Junior Kenny Collins, a high-scoring 
forward from Valley Springs, Ark., was 
named to the Academic All-America team 
by the College Sports Information Directors 
of America (CoSIDA). He has earned a 3.4 
grade point average (on a 4.0 scale) while 
pursuing a major in pre-veterinary 
medicine. 

Collins was also a unanimous selectiOn to 
the All-Arkansas Intercollegiate Conference 
team and received NAIA All-District 17 
honors. The Bisons' leading scorer ,and 
rebounder, Collins scored 444 season points 
to enable him to break the 1,000 career 
point mark with 1,076 points and rank 14th 
on Harding's all-time scoring list. The 6-6, 
190 lb. standout averaged 14.8 points and 
6.9 rebounds per game in his third season as 
a starter. 

For the Lady Bisons, junior college 
transfer Kim Wilkins of Flippin, Ark., was 
named to the NAIA All-District 17 team 
and was an All-AIC honorable mention 
performer from her forward spot. Wilkins 
averaged 14 points and 6.7 rebounds per 

game as she led the Lady Bisons in both 
departments. 

Another strong performer at forward for 
the women's team, junior college transfer 
Dena Sims of Pernell, Okla., ranked in the 
top ten conference shooters as she recorded 
a .513 percent average from the field. 

A strong contributor to the men's scoring 
output was senior forward Rich Foster of 
Festus, Mo. He used an outstanding 
shooting touch from the outside to rank 
second on the Bisons' scoring list with an 
average of 14.1 points per contest. This 
year's team captain, Foster's outstanding 
performance brought him honorable 
mention status on both the All-AIC and 
NAIA All-District 17 teams. 

Another senior who played a vital ~Ie for 
the Bisons, guard Dwight Weaver of 
Wheatley, Ark., was an NAIA All-District 
17 honorable mention choice. A strong 
rebounder and fine pressure shooter, 
Weaver was second on the team in the 
rebounding depart~ent with an average of 
6.0 per game and was third on the season 
scoring list as he averaged 12.4 points per 
game. 

The men also enjoyed fine performances 
from seniors David Allumbaugh and Troy 
Sanstra who provided the squad with depth 
and experience while seeing action in all of 
the team's 30 games. 

Allumbaugh, 'a four year letterman 
forward out of Dallas, hit a solid .502 
percent of his field goal tries and boasted an 
.806 percent success rate at the free throw 
line. Sanstra, a four-year letterman center 
from Tulsa, provided the inside muscle 
while hitting .627 percent of his shots from 
the field. 

While compiling a 13-17 overalI record 
and a 5-13 AIC mark, the Bisons ranked 
second in the conference in field goal 
percentage with an impressive .517 percent 
showing. At the free throw line, Harding hit 
.693 percent of their tries to rank fifth in the 
conference. 

Seniors Lynette Gardner and Ginger 
Berry provided experience and leadership 
for the Lady Bisons' inside game while 
taking the floor in all 26 outings. Gardner, a 
forward from Andover, Kan., was second on 
the team in rebounding with an average of 
4.9 pee game and scored at a 6.6 point$.per 
game average. Berry, a center from Manila, 
Ark., contributed to the team's scoring 
efforts with 4.1 points per game and pulled 
down three rebounds a game: 

The Lady Bisons finished their second 
season, of play with a 4-22 record overalI and 
1-15 in the highly competitive AIC while 
ranking seventh in the conference in free 
throw accuracy at .633 percent and ninth in 
field goal proficiency at .385 percent. 

Page 23 



H do U 0 0ty Harding University admits students of any race, color, and national or ethnic origin. Also, In 
ar log DIVerS) compliance with Title IX of the Educational Amendments of 1972, and section 504 of the Reha-

B U LLETI N bilitation Act of 1973, Harding Univel1llty does not discrimInate on the basis of sex or handicap in 
its educational program, activities, or employmen!,except where necessitated by specific religious 
tenets held by the institution and its· conlrolUng body. 

"If I Be Lifted Up 0 
" 

U~P·~'L·l·F·T 
June 23-28, 1985 .. . 

Harding University 
Uplift is a new program designed to provide unique spiritual experiences for. -------------

young people on Harding University's campus in Searcy. Outstanding speakers ·. ~. 
will be addressing the theme "If I Be Lifted Up." This camp is designed for 
students entering the 9th grade through high school graduates. 

Recreational activities include bowling, swimming, basketball, tennis, 
softball, soccer, volleyball, weight room, racquetball and movies. 

Items to bring: Twin. size sheets or sleeping bags, pillow, $15-$25 for 
recreation plirposes and Bibles, Gym clothes (shorts) are o.k. for sports only. 

Cost: $75.00 per person which includes 14 meals, registration fee and five ------------­
nights in the University's dorm. 

Keynote speakers will be: Gary Martin ofVero Beach, Fla.; Ronnie White of 
Oklahoma City, Okla.; leff Walling of Mission Viejo, Cal.; ~uddy Bell of ----~------­
Tuscaloosa, Ala.; Jimmy Allen of Harding University. 

Some of the teachers will be: Rob Gerst, Benny Biddle, Buddy Mills, Gibby 
Gilbert, Dan Sedgewick, Dudly Chancy, Donny Hilliard, Wib Newton, Charlie 
Hester, Mike Harris,: Richard Ellis, Mike McCloud, Gary Blackwell, Matt 
Flanigan.. . 

For more information write to: UPLIFT, Harding University, Box 939, _11111 ____ -!1 _____ _ 

Station A, Searcy, Ark. 72143. 

Address Correction Request: 

Harding University 
Station A, Box 759 
Searcy, Ark. 72143 
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